

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF FLORIDA
WEST PALM BEACH DIVISION
CASE NO.: 9:17-cv-80393-RLR

_____	x
	:
CHARLES S. FISHMAN, on behalf of himself :	:
and others similarly situated,	:
	:
Plaintiff,	:
	:
vs.	:
	:
NPAS SOLUTIONS, LLC,	:
	:
Defendant.	:
_____	x

DECLARATION OF MICHAEL L. GREENWALD

I, Michael L. Greenwald, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, declare as follows:

1. My name is Michael L. Greenwald.
2. I am over twenty-one years of age.
3. I am fully competent to make the statements contained in this declaration.
4. I am a partner at the law firm of Greenwald Davidson Radbil PLLC (“GDR”).
5. I graduated from the University of Virginia in 2001 and Duke University School of Law in 2004.
6. I was awarded the Justin Miller Award for Leadership in 2004 from Duke University School of Law.
7. I have been practicing law for 20 years.
8. I am Court-appointed class counsel for the settlement class in this action.
9. GDR, which focuses on consumer protection class action litigation, has attorneys in Boca Raton and Austin, Texas.
10. I am admitted to practice before this Court.

GDR's Experience

11. GDR's attorneys have extensive experience litigating consumer protection class actions, including class actions under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act ("TCPA").

12. As court-appointed class counsel in TCPA class actions, GDR has helped to recover more than \$150 million over the past eight years, including in the following cases:

- *Cornelius v. Deere Credit Services, Inc.*, No. 4:24-cv-25-RSB-CLR (S.D. Ga.);
- *Smith v. Assurance IQ, LLC*, No. 2023-CH-092252 (Cook County, Ill.);
- *Fralish v. Ceteris Portfolio Servs., LLC*, No. 3:22-CV-176-DRL-MGG (N.D. Ind.);
- *Jackson v. Discover Fin. Servs. Inc.*, No. 1:21-cv-04529 (N.D. Ill.);
- *Lucas v. Synchrony Bank*, No. 4:21-cv-00070-PPS (N.D. Ind.);
- *Wesley v. Snap Fin. LLC*, No. 2:20-cv-00148-RJS-JCB (D. Utah);
- *Miles v. Medicredit, Inc.*, No. 4:20-cv-1186-JAR (E.D. Mo.);
- *Davis v. Mindshare Ventures LLC et al.*, No. 4:19-cv-1961 (S.D. Tex.);
- *Bonoan v. Adobe, Inc.*, No. 3:19-cv-01068-RS (N.D. Cal.);
- *Neal v. Wal-Mart Stores, Inc. and Synchrony Bank*, No. 3:17-cv-00022 (W.D.N.C.);
- *Jewell v. HSN, Inc.*, No. 3:19-cv-00247-jdp (W.D. Wis.);
- *Knapper v. Cox Commc'ns, Inc.*, No. 2:17-cv-00913-SPL (D. Ariz.);
- *Sheean v. Convergent Outsourcing, Inc.*, No. 2:18-cv-11532-GCS-RSW (E.D. Mich.);
- *Williams v. Bluestem Brands, Inc.*, No. 8:17-cv-01971-T-27AAS (M.D. Fla.);
- *Martinez, et al., v. Medicredit, Inc.*, No. 4:16-cv-01138 ERW (E.D. Mo.);
- *Luster v. Wells Fargo Dealer Servs., Inc.*, No. 1:15-cv-01058-TWT (N.D. Ga.);
- *Prather v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.*, No. 1:15-cv-04231-SCJ (N.D. Ga.);
- *Johnson v. Navient Solutions, Inc., f/k/a Sallie Mae, Inc.*, No. 1:15-cv-0716-LJM (S.D. Ind.);
- *Toure and Heard v. Navient Solutions, Inc., f/k/a Sallie Mae, Inc.*, No. 1:17-cv-00071-

- LJM-TAB (S.D. Ind.);
- *James v. JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A.*, No. 8:15-cv-2424-T-23JSS (M.D. Fla.);
 - *Schwyhart v. AmSher Collection Servs., Inc.*, No. 2:15-cv-1175-JEO (N.D. Ala.);
 - *Cross v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.*, No. 2:15-cv-01270-RWS (N.D. Ga.);
 - *Markos v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.*, No. 15-1156 (N.D. Ga.);
 - *Prater v. Medicredit, Inc.*, No. 14-00159 (E.D. Mo.);
 - *Jones v. I.Q. Data Int'l, Inc.*, No. 1:14-cv-00130-PJK-GBW (D.N.M.); and
 - *Ritchie v. Van Ru Credit Corp.*, No. 2:12-CV-01714-PHX-SM (D. Ariz.).

13. In addition, GDR has been appointed class counsel in dozens of class actions brought under consumer protection statutes other than the TCPA, including:

- *Taylor v. TimePayment Corp.*, No. 3:18-cv-00378-MHL-DJN (E.D. Va.);
- *Danger v. Nextep Funding, LLC*, No. 0:18-cv-00567-SRN-LIB (D. Minn.);
- *Spencer v. #1 A LifeSafer of Ariz. LLC*, No. 18-02225-PHX-BSB (D. Ariz.);
- *Dickens v. GC Servs. Ltd. P'Ship*, No. 8:16-cv-00803-JSM-TGW (M.D. Fla.);
- *Kagno v. Bush Ross, P.A.*, No. 8:17-cv-1468-T-26AEP (M.D. Fla.);
- *Johnston v. Kass Shuler, P.A.*, No. 8:16-cv-03390-SDM-AEP (M.D. Fla.);
- *Jallo v. Resurgent Capital Servs., L.P.*, No. 4:14-cv-00449 (E.D. Tex.);
- *Macy v. GC Servs. Ltd. P'ship*, No. 3:15-cv-00819-DJH-CHL (W.D. Ky.);
- *Rhodes v. Nat'l Collection Sys., Inc.*, No. 15-cv-02049-REB-KMT (D. Colo.);
- *McCurdy v. Prof'l Credit Servs.*, No. 6:15-cv-01498-AA (D. Or.);
- *Globus v. Pioneer Credit Recovery, Inc.*, No. 15-CV-152V (W.D.N.Y.);
- *Roundtree v. Bush Ross, P.A.*, No. 8:14-cv-00357-JDW-AEP (M.D. Fla.); and
- *Gonzalez v. Germaine Law Office PLC*, No. 2:15-cv-01427-PHX-ROS (D. Ariz.).

14. In certifying a TCPA class and appointing GDR as co-class counsel, Judge Rosyln O.

Silver of the District of Arizona wrote:

Moreover, the quality of Plaintiff's filings to this point, as well as the declarations submitted by the proposed class counsel, Michael Greenwald (Doc. 120-6) . . . persuade the Court that Head, Greenwald, and Wilson will continue to vigorously prosecute this action on behalf of the class.

* * *

Significantly, class counsel have provided a list of well over a dozen class actions Greenwald, Wilson, and their respective firms have each litigated, including several under the TCPA. (Doc. 120-6 at 5-6; Doc. 120-7 at 2-7). These showings demonstrate counsel's experience in handling class actions, complex litigation, and the types of claims asserted in this action. *See* Fed. R. Civ. P. 23(g)(1)(A)(ii).

Head v. Citibank, N.A., 340 F.R.D. 145, 152 (D. Ariz. 2022).

15. As well, in *Ritchie*, Judge Stephen P. McNamee of District of Arizona stated upon granting final approval to the TCPA settlement at issue:

I want to thank all of you. It's been a pleasure. I hope that you will come back and see us at some time in the future. And if you don't, I have a lot of cases I would like to assign you, because you've been immensely helpful both to your clients and to the Court. And that's important. So I want to thank you all very much.

No. CIV-12-1714 (D. Ariz. July 21, 2014).

16. Other district courts likewise have commented on GDR's useful knowledge and experience in connection with class action litigation.

17. For instance, in preliminarily approving the class action settlement in *Chapman v. Bowman, Heintz, Boscia & Vician, P.C.*, Judge Jon E. DeGuilio of the Northern District of Indiana wrote:

No doubt Michael L. Greenwald of Greenwald Davidson Radbil PLLC has put extensive work into reviewing and investigating the potential claims in this case, and he and his firm have experience in handling class action litigation. Additionally, Mr. Greenwald has demonstrated his knowledge of the FDCPA and he has so far committed the resources necessary to representing the class and administrating the proposed settlement. The Court believes that Mr. Greenwald will fairly and adequately represent the interests

of the class; and therefore, in compliance with Rule 23(g)(1), it is **ORDERED** that Michael Greenwald of Greenwald Davidson Radbil PLLC is appointed Class Counsel.

No. 2:15-cv-120 JD, 2015 WL 9478548, at *6 (N.D. Ind. Dec. 29, 2016).

18. In *Schwychart*, Judge John E. Ott, Chief Magistrate Judge of the Northern District of Alabama, stated upon granting final approval to a TCPA settlement for which he appointed GDR as class counsel:

I cannot reiterate enough how impressed I am with both your handling of the case, both in the Court's presence as well as on the phone conferences, as well as in the written materials submitted. . . . I am very satisfied and I am very pleased with what I have seen in this case. As a judge, I don't get to say that every time, so that is quite a compliment to you all, and thank you for that.

No. 2:15-cv-1175-JEO (N.D. Ala. Mar. 15, 2017).

19. Judge Carlton W. Reeves of the Southern District of Mississippi described GDR as follows:

More important, frankly, is the skill with which plaintiff's counsel litigated this matter. On that point there is no disagreement. Defense counsel concedes that her opponent—a specialist in the field who has been class counsel in dozens of these matters across the country—“is to be commended for his work” for the class, “was professional at all times” ..., and used his “excellent negotiation skills” to achieve a settlement fund greater than that required by the law.

The undersigned concurs ... Counsel's level of experience in handling cases brought under the FDCPA, other consumer protection statutes, and class actions generally cannot be overstated.

McWilliams v. Advanced Recovery Sys., Inc., No. 3:15-CV-70-CWR-LRA, 2017 WL 2625118, at *3 (S.D. Miss. June 16, 2017).

20. As well, Judge Steven D. Merryday of the Middle District of Florida wrote in appointing GDR class counsel in *James* that “Michael L. Greenwald, James L. Davidson, and Aaron D. Radbil of Greenwald Davidson Radbil PLLC, each . . . has significant experience litigating TCPA

class actions.” 2016 WL 6908118, at *1.

21. In *Bellum v. Law Offices of Frederic I. Weinberg & Assocs., P.C.*, Judge C. Darnell Jones II of the Eastern District of Pennsylvania took care to point out that GDR was appointed as class counsel “precisely because of their expertise and ability to represent the class in this matter.” 2016 WL 4766079, at *5 (E.D. Pa. Sept. 13, 2016).

22. Similarly, in *Cooper v. InvestiNet, LLC*, Chief Judge Tanya Walton Pratt of the Southern District of Indiana wrote:

GDR is an experienced firm that has successfully litigated many complex consumer class actions, including under the FDCPA. Because of its experience, GDR has been appointed class counsel in many class actions throughout the country, including in this district. GDR employed that experience here in negotiating a favorable result that avoids protracted litigation, trial, and appeals.

No. 1:21-cv-01562-TWP-DML, 2022 WL 1125394 (S.D. Ind. April 14, 2022).

23. Additional information about GDR is available at www.gdrllawfirm.com.

Michael L. Greenwald

24. Prior to forming GDR in 2012, I spent six years as a litigator at Robbins Geller Rudman & Dowd LLP—one of the nation’s largest plaintiff’s class action firms.

25. My practice at Robbins Geller focused on complex class actions, including securities and consumer protection litigation.

26. While at Robbins Geller, I served on the litigation teams responsible for the successful prosecution of numerous class actions, including: *In re Evergreen Ultra Short Opportunities Fund Sec. Litig.* (D. Mass.); *In re Red Hat, Inc. Sec. Litig.* (E.D.N.C.); *City of Ann Arbor Emps.’ Ret. Sys. v. Sonoco Prods. Co., et al.* (D.S.C.); *Norfolk Cnty. Ret. Sys., et. al. v. Ustian* (N.D. Ill.); *Romero v. U.S. Unwired, Inc.* (E.D. La.); *Lefkoe v. Jos. A. Bank Clothiers, Inc.* (D. Md.); and *In re Odimo, Inc. Sec. Litig.* (Fla.).

27. I started my career as an attorney in the Fort Lauderdale office of Holland & Knight LLP.

28. Other GDR attorneys also contributed to the successful prosecution of this case, including partners Aaron D. Radbil, James L. Davidson, and Jesse S. Johnson, as well as former associate Alexander D. Kruzyk.

Aaron D. Radbil

29. Mr. Radbil graduated from the University of Arizona in 2002 and from the University of Miami School of Law in 2006.

30. Mr. Radbil has extensive experience litigating consumer protection class actions, including those under the TCPA.

31. In addition to his experience litigating consumer protection class actions, Mr. Radbil has briefed, argued, and prevailed on a variety of issues of significant consumer interest before federal courts of appeals.

James L. Davidson

32. Mr. Davidson graduated from the University of Florida in 2000 and the University of Florida Fredric G. Levin College of Law in 2003.

33. He has been appointed class counsel in a host of consumer protection class actions.

34. Prior to forming GDR, Mr. Davidson spent five years as a litigator at Robbins Geller, where he focused on complex class actions, including securities and consumer protection litigation.

Jesse S. Johnson

35. Mr. Johnson earned his Bachelor of Science degree in Business Administration from the University of Florida, where he graduated magna cum laude in 2005.

36. He earned his Juris Doctor degree with honors from the University of Florida Fredric G. Levin College of Law in 2009, along with his Master of Arts in Business Administration from the

University of Florida Hough Graduate School of Business the same year.

37. While an attorney at GDR, Mr. Johnson has been appointed class counsel in more than a dozen consumer protection class actions.

38. Mr. Johnson started his legal career as an associate at Robbins Geller, where he served on the litigation teams responsible for the successful prosecution of numerous class actions, including: *Sterling Heights Gen. Emps. ' Ret. Sys. v. Hospira, Inc.*, No. 1:11-cv-08332 (N.D. Ill.); *Eshe Fund v. Fifth Third Bancorp*, No. 1:08-cv-00421 (S.D. Ohio); *City of St. Clair Shores Gen. Emps. ' Ret. Sys. v. Lender Processing Servs., Inc.*, No. 3:10-cv-01073 (M.D. Fla.); and *In re Synovus Fin. Corp.*, No. 1:09-cv-01811 (N.D. Ga.).

Alexander D. Kruzyk

39. Alexander D. Kruzyk was an associate at GDR and is now a partner at Pardell, Kruzyk & Giribaldo, PLLC.

40. Mr. Kruzyk earned his Bachelor of Management and Organizational Studies from the University of Western Ontario in 2011 and earned his Juris Doctor degree with honors from the University of Florida Fredric G. Levin College of Law in 2014.

GDR Devoted Extraordinary Resources to this Case For More Than Seven Years

41. This case has been pending since March 28, 2017.

42. In connection with the original proceedings in this Court, GDR: (a) conducted an investigation into the underlying facts regarding the claims of Charles T. Johnson, the original class representative, and those of class members; (b) prepared a class action complaint; (c) researched the law pertinent to class members' claims and NPAS Solutions, LLC's defenses; (d) prepared an amended class action complaint; (e) prepared and served initial written discovery requests, negotiated with NPAS Solutions regarding its discovery responses and production of documents, reviewed and analyzed the document production, and gathered documents and information relevant

to NPAS Solutions' discovery requests to Mr. Johnson; (f) researched issues related to class certification, including strategies for how to best satisfy the requirements of Rule 23; (g) engaged an expert witness and worked with the expert on her report; (h) negotiated the parameters of the \$1.432 million class action settlement; (i) prepared the parties' class action settlement agreement, along with the proposed class notice and claim form; (j) prepared Mr. Johnson's motion for preliminary approval of the class action settlement and motion for final approval of the class action settlement; (k) conferred with the class administrator to oversee the notice, claims, and administration process, including the negotiation of a hard cap on notice and administration costs; and (l) repeatedly conferred with Mr. Johnson.

43. Since this Court originally approved the settlement in 2018, GDR has worked diligently to protect class members' recoveries. This includes two rounds of briefing before the Eleventh Circuit, as well as proceedings on remand.

44. In addition, GDR successfully obtained the appointment of Mr. Fishman as the new class representative after the passing of Mr. Johnson.

45. It was not until 2024—six years after judgment was entered in this case—that Ms. Dickenson abandoned her objection to the amount of the settlement.

46. GDR has handled this case on a contingency.

47. GDR is a small law firm, now with only four attorneys.

48. GDR has received no payment for its work on this case to date.

49. GDR attorneys contemporaneously record their time through billing software. GDR's time entries are maintained electronically in the ordinary course of GDR's business.

50. GDR attorneys bill in increments of one-tenth of an hour.

51. I have reviewed GDR's time entries in connection with the preparation of this declaration. The purpose of this review was to confirm both the accuracy of the entries as well as

the necessity for, and reasonableness of, the time committed to the litigation. As a result of this review, reductions were made to GDR's time in the exercise of billing judgment.

52. In total, 59.5 hours were written off and removed from GDR's lodestar calculation.

53. As of November 22, 2024, and excluding hours written off in an exercise of billing judgment, GDR's attorneys have spent a total of 918.4 hours litigating this case.

54. Based on this review and the downward adjustments made, I believe that the time reflected in GDR's lodestar calculation is reasonable and necessary for the effective and efficient prosecution and resolution of the litigation, including the many years of appellate proceedings.

55. A report of GDR's time entries in this matter, segregated by timekeeper, is appended hereto as Exhibit 1.

56. Of note, the time submitted herewith only encompasses time expended by GDR. It does not include time spent by other firms of record in connection with appellate proceedings, such as a petition for rehearing en banc before the Eleventh Circuit, a petition for writ of certiorari to the Supreme Court, and an opposition to Ms. Dickenson's petition for writ of certiorari.

57. I, along with Mr. Davidson and Mr. Radbil, bill on this case at a rate of \$550 per hour.

58. Mr. Johnson bills on this case at a rate of \$500 per hour; Mr. Kruzyk billed at a rate of \$450 per hour.

59. Multiplying the hours incurred by each GDR attorney by his applicable hourly rate produces a lodestar of \$498,855.00.

60. It is unknown how many additional hours GDR will expend in connection with this matter, as objector Dickenson could appeal additional orders from this Court.

61. Regardless, and as has been the case throughout the pendency of these proceedings, GDR will devote all time and resources necessary to protect the class settlement and see to it that

participating settlement class members receive their payments. Notwithstanding its lodestar, GDR does not seek, nor will it seek, additional attorneys' fees from the common fund beyond the \$429,000 awarded by this Court.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct to the best of my knowledge.

Executed on December 13, 2024

By: *s/Michael L. Greenwald*
Michael L. Greenwald

EXHIBIT 1

Greenwald Davidson Radbil PLLC - Summary Report

Date Start: 1/1/2016 | Date End: 11/22/2024 | Clients: Johnson, Charles T. | Projects: NPAS Solutions | Users: All | Account Managers: All | Group By: User

Date	Client	Project	Description	Billing Status	Rate/ Unit Price	Labor Time/ Quantity	Non-billable Amount	Billable Time/ Cost Price	Bill Amt/ Sell Price
Aaron Radbil									
03/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, and JJ regarding potential claims	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits to draft class action complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft joint report and proposed order, and suggest edits and revisions	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's motion to dismiss, and correspond with MG, JD and JJ regarding related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits and revisions to draft amended class action complaint	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits to draft initial discovery requests	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits to draft initial disclosures	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding status of case and potential mediators	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying motion to strike	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, and JJ regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, and JJ regarding status of case and mediation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research mediators suggested by Defendant, and discuss with MG	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding status of case and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AK regarding status of case and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Correspond with MG regarding client request and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's proposed protective order and discuss questions and concerns with MG	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case and related strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft declaration of Anya Verkhovskaya; review and note transcript of Anya Verkhovskaya in Johnson v. Navient and mark potential problem areas; suggest revisions to draft declaration of Anya Verkhovskaya	Ready	550.00 hr	2.10	0.00	2.10	1,155.00
08/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case and related strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JJ, and AK regarding status of case and related case strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG and JD regarding status of case and case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and edit draft settlement proposal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding expert discovery and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits to draft notice of deposition(s) pursuant to Rule 30(b)(6).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/16/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding class certification and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review counter-offer from OC; discuss with MG	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG prior to settlement conference with OC	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG and JD following settlement conference with OC	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00

10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft term sheet and note comments.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and MG regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case and administration	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails from KCC regarding status of class administration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case and class administration	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/31/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, and JJ regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review claims rate and related information from KCC	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objection to class settlement from Jenna Dickenson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss strategy regarding objection with MG	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding objection and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and JD regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggested edits and revisions to Plaintiff's response to objection, Motion for final approval of settlement, Motion for attorneys' fees, expenses, and incentive award, and MG declaration ISO motion for attorneys' fees	Ready	550.00 hr	3.20	0.00	3.20	1,760.00
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversations with MG regarding objection and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with John Davis (.1); follow up discussion with MG (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review emails from John W. Davis (.1); correspond with MG and OC (.1); discuss with MG (.3)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and note concerns with draft response to objection from NPAS (.3); discuss with MG (.1)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding Jenna Dickenson objection; related call with MG and Doug Campion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from John Davis and attached motion	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final order and judgment in Muransky v. Godiva, in the Southern District of Florida.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review related materials regarding, and correspond with MG about, John Davis's motion for sanctions	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy and John Davis filings	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with John Davis (.2); follow up discussion with MG (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review affidavit of Jenna Dickenson	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Contact John Davis (left message with his assistant)	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with John Davis (.1); follow up discussion with MG regarding related case strategy (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss with MG regarding objection, final fairness hearing, and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review John W. Davis Rule 11 order in Monitorics TCPA litigation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

04/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review John W Davis-related-materials from Medtronics TCPA litigation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
04/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Contact John W. Davis's office, spoke to his assistant, and left voice message for him	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with John W. Davis	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re appeal bond and consider appropriateness of same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
06/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review research regarding appeal bonds and related case law	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding Jenna Dickenson objection	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/18/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's certificate of interested persons, civil appeal statement, and transcript form, before the 11th Circuit	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Pearson v. Target Corp. et al, No. 17-2275 (7th Cir. Jun. 26, 2018) (objector appeals)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
08/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG and opposing counsel regarding appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/10/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and note objector's opening brief on appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
08/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits to draft mediation statement to the 11th Cir.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding upcoming mediation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG and JD regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read filings on appeal; review and notes suggested edits to draft response brief on appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	880.00
09/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding case strategy and appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Muransky v. Godova Chocolatier, Inc., No. 16-16486 (11th Cir. Oct. 3, 2018) (objection to class settlement, notice of fee petition, amount of fee, incentive award, standing)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding appeal and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft Rule 28j letter and suggest edits/revisions	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
10/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case/claims	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/20/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/20/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG, JD, and AK regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/10/2019	Johnson,	NPAS	Conversation with MG, JD, JJ, and AK regarding	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00

	Charles T.	Solutions	status of case							
05/01/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team regarding status of case and case strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
05/08/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team regarding case strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
06/05/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case and related strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
06/19/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
07/31/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
08/21/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
09/04/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
10/08/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's notice of supplemental authority regarding Muransky.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
10/10/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
10/16/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
10/30/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
11/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
01/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
01/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
01/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
02/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG and JD regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
02/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
03/04/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
03/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to correspondence from class member.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
03/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
04/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
04/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from class member Adkins.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
05/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review notice from court of appeals regarding telephonic argument or stipulation to submission on the briefs (.1); related emails with litigation team (.1)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
05/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
06/01/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's answer brief on appeal, and note for mock oral argument	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00	
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
06/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and note briefing on appeal, briefing before district court regarding settlement, and related orders, in preparation mock oral argument prior to June 12, 2020 argument before 11th Cir.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00	
06/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attend and participate in mock oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	715.00	
06/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
06/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding upcoming oral argument before the 11th Cir.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00	
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument (.8); follow up discussion with MG (.3)	Ready	550.00 hr	1.10	0.00	1.10	605.00	
06/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy and appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
06/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review Defendant's June 22, 2020 notice of supplemental authority	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
06/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review Defendant's June 23, 2020 notice of supplemental authority	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
07/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Barr v. American Association of Political Consultants, Inc., No.19-631, 591 U.S. ____ (2020) (constitutionality of the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00	
07/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00	
07/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Allan v. Pennsylvania Higher Educ. Assistance Agency, No. 19-2043, 2020 WL 4345341 (6th Cir. July 29, 2020) (definition of an automatic telephone dialing system)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00	

07/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Pearson v. Target Corp., No. 19-3095, 2020 WL 4519053 (7th Cir. Aug. 6, 2020) (class action settlement objectors)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider decision from Eleventh Circuit and consideration of next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with JJ regarding 11th Cir. opinion, petition for rehearing, and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding 11th Cir. opinion, petition for rehearing, and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding case strategy regarding petition for rehearing en banc and appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG and JD regarding case strategy regarding petition for rehearing en banc and appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Calls with MG, JD, and other counsel regarding case strategy, appeal, en banc petition, amicus briefs, etc.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.00	0.00	2.00	1,100.00
09/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding appeal strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/24/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding case strategy on appeal, possible amicus filings, and related issues	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read and mark-up draft petition for en banc hearing before 11th Circuit (.5); discuss edits and comments with MG (.3)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
10/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/20/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider updated draft petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Dickenson petition for rehearing en banc (.5); related discussion with MG (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
10/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding Plaintiff's petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Lindenbaum v. Realgy, LLC, No. 1:19 CV 2862, 2020 WL 6361915 (N.D. Ohio Oct. 29, 2020) (holding calls made during time that government debt exception existed are not actionable under the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief of Main Street Alliance in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief of Public Justice in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief of Charles N. Nauen for The Committee to Support the Antitrust Laws in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief of Impact Fund and 14 Non-Profit Legal and Advocacy Organizations in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief of 26 Professors of Law in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief of Martin N. Buchanan for Professor William B. Rubenstein in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding amicus filings in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Petitioner Facebook's reply brief to the Supreme Court in Facebook v. Duguid, No. 19-511 (definition of an ATDS under the TCPA), and consideration of impact of adverse ruling on autodialer claims.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument in Facebook, Inc. v. Duguid	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
12/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Trujillo v. Free Energy, No. 5:19-cv-02072-MCS-SP, ECF No 76 (C.D. Cal. Dec. 21, 2020) (order denying Rule 12(b)(1) MTD based on Creasy, Lindenbaum, and Hussain)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/06/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/12/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Stoutt v. Travis Credit Union, No. 2:20-cv-01280 WBS AC (E.D. Cal. Jan. 12, 2021) (opinion denying the defendant's Rule 12(b)(1) motion to dismiss based on Creasy and Lindenbaum)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Quest Diagnostics Incorporated, No. 3:20-cv-02546-JZ (N.D. Ohio Jan. 26, 2021) (Article III standing under the robocall restriction fo the TCPA, and refusing to accept Creasy and Lindenbaum)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with MG regarding status of petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/27/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read McCurley v. Royal Sea Cruises, Inc., Defendant., No. 17-CV-00986-BAS-AGS, 2021 WL 288164 (S.D. Cal. Jan. 28, 2021) (Article III	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

standing under the TCPA, rejecting Creasy and Lindenbaum)

02/02/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Johansen v. Loandepot.com LLC, No. :20-cv-00919-DOC-JDE (S.D. Cal. Jan 31, 2021) (subject matter jurisdiction over claims under the TCPA following AAPC)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/03/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Cherry v. Dometic Corp., No. 19-13242, 2021 WL 346121 (11th Cir. Feb. 2, 2021) (Rule 23, ascertainability, and administratively feasibility)	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
02/16/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Bonkuri v. Gran Caribbean Cruises, Inc., No. 20-cv-60638-WPD (S.D. Fla. January 19, 2021) (standing under the TCPA, and rejecting Creasy, Lindembaum, and Hussain)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/23/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief for intervenor-appellant (U.S. Department of Justice) in Lindenbaum v. Realgy, LLC, No. 20-4252, Doc. 33 (6th Cir. Feb. 16, 2021)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/23/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read brief for amicus curiae (32 states and the District of Columbia) in Lindenbaum v. Realgy, LLC, No. 20-4252, Doc. 27 (6th Cir. Feb. 1, 2021)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read and note the United States of America's Brief in Support of the Constitutionality of the Telephone Consumer Protection Act in Massaro v. People for the Ethical Treatment of Animals, Inc., No. 3:20-cv-00510-AJB-MSB (S.D. Cal. Feb. 26, 2021)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
03/10/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Miles v. Medcredit, Inc., No. 4:20-CV-01186 JAR 2021 WL 872678 (E.D. Mo. Mar. 9, 2021) ("the clear majority of cases to consider this issue have allowed parties to continue to bring Å§ 227(b) claims post-AAPC")	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/15/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Boisvert v. Carnival Corporation, No. 8:20-cv-02076-JSM-SPF, Doc. 30 (M.D. Fla. Mar. 12, 2021) (denying Creasy motion to dismiss, and effectively overruling Hussain)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/15/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Massaro v. Beyond Meat, Inc., 3:20-cv-00510-AJB-MSB (S.D. Cal. Mar. 12, 2021) (denying motion to dismiss TCPA action based on several arguments, including the constitutionality of the robocall restriction post 2015 amendment but pre AAPC--rejecting Creasy, Lindembaum, and Hussain)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/24/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read and note Facebook, Inc. v. Duguid, et al., No. 19-511 (April 1, 2021) (definition of an automatic telephone dialing system, and consideration of impact n autodialer claims).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
04/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Moody v. Synchrony Bank, No. 5:20-CV-61 (MTT), 2021 WL 1153036 (M.D. Ga. Mar. 26, 2021) (subject matter jurisdiction over robocall restriction claims, rejecting Creasy)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/06/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read CRAIG CUNNINGHAM, Plaintiff, v. MATRIX FINANCIAL SERVICES, LLC, ET AL., Defendants. No. 4:19-CV-896, 2021 WL 1226618 (E.D. Tex. Mar. 31, 2021) (subject matter jurisdiction over robocall restriction claims stemming from post-amendment but pre-Barr period)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/30/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Mich. Urgent Care & Primary Care Physicians, P.C. v. Medical Security Card Co., No. 2:20-CV-10353-TGB, 2021 WL 1663619 (E.D. Mich. Apr. 28, 2021) (holding that a plaintiff may bring robocall restriction claims that arise post-2015 amendment but pre AAPC (.2); Mey v. MedGuard Alert, Inc., No. 5:19- CV-315, 2021 WL 1652945 (N.D.W. Va. Apr. 27, 2021) (same) (.3); Gunn v. Prospects DM, LLC, No. 4:19CV3129 HEA, 2021 WL 1534234 (E.D. Mo. Apr. 19, 2021) (same) (.2); Whittaker v. WinRed Tech. Servs. LLC, No. CV-20-08150-PCT-JJT, 2021 WL 1102297 (D. Ariz. Mar. 23, 2021) (same) (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
05/10/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider LERNER v. AMERIFINANCIAL SOLUTIONS, LLC, et al., No. CV GLR-20-965, 2021 WL 1785138 (D. Md. May 5, 2021) (rejecting Creasy, Lindenbaum, and Hussain, and denying motion to dismiss post-amendment/pre-AAPC robocall restriction claims)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/17/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Walker v. Highmark BCBS Health Options, Inc., No. 2:20-cv-01975-CCW, ECF No. 28 ("Because the Supreme Court in AAPC severed the government debt exception, rather than invalidating the TCPA's robocall restriction in its entirety, parties may be liable for violations during the 2015-2020 period.[J]")	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review proposed supplemental authority in support of petition for rehearing en banc (.1); related discussion with MG and JD (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/09/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Lindenbaum v. Really, LLC, No. 20-4252 (6th Cir. Sept. 9, 2021) (constitutionality of the TCPA's robocall restriction)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/02/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read and note Brown v. DirectTV, LLC, No. 2:13-cv-01170-DMG-E, ECF No. 401 (C.D. Cal. Dec. 1, 2021) (denying the defendant's motion to decertify a wrong-number TCPA class)	Ready	0 hr	0.40	220.00	0	0.00
02/23/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00

03/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/11/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/01/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Arkin v. Pressman, Inc., No. 21-11019, 2022 WL 2352522 (11th Cir. June 30, 2022) (common fund attorneys' fees in TCPA class actions)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/11/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Moskowitz v. Am. Sav. Bank, F.S.B., 37 F.4th 538 (9th Cir. 2022) (attorneys fees as costs under the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/20/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/28/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Drazen v. Pinto, No. 21-10199, 2022 WL 2963470 (11th Cir. July 27, 2022) (Article III standing required in connection with TCPA class action settlements)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding appeal-related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with Ashley Keller and MG regarding possible petition for certiorari (.4); follow up discussion with MG (.4)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
08/08/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Johnson v. NPAS, 2022 WL 3083717 (11th Cir.) (order denying petition for rehearing en banc, and dissents, regarding incentive awards in Rule 23 class actions)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	In preparation for strategy call regarding possible petition for certiorari, read Defendant's motion to strike class allegations included in Plaintiff's original class action complaint, Defendant's motion to strike class allegations included in Plaintiff's amended class action complaint, the court's order preliminarily approving the class action settlement, and the court's order finally approving the class action settlement	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
08/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG and JD regarding potential petition for certiorari and related case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with JD regarding case strategy related to potential petition for writ of certiorari	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with Scott Grant regarding potential petition for writ of certiorari (.5); follow ups discussion with MG and JD (.4)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read email and attachment from JD regarding strategy related to possible petition for writ of certiorari	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding case strategy and petition for certiorari	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/29/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order preliminarily approving wrong number TCPA class action in Brown v. DirectTV, LLC, Case 2:13-cv-01170-DMG-E (C.D. Cal. Aug. 24, 2022)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/31/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Hyland v. Navient Corporation, Case No. 20-3765-cv (2nd Cir. Sep. 7, 2022) (incentive and cy president awards in connection with Rule 23 settlements)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/20/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review admission to Supreme Court requirements and instructions; prepare application for AR admission; related communications with sponsors; discussion with litigation team regarding logistics of signing and mailing application for admission	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
10/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider BRIAN WATSON, ET AL., Plaintiffs, v. MANHATTAN LUXURY AUTOMOBILES, INC., Defendant, No. 20 CIV. 4572 (LGS), 2022 WL 4586407 (S.D.N.Y. Sept. 29, 2022) (class certification and Daubert analysis in a TCPA class action)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Chenette v. Porch.com, Inc., No. 20-35962, 2022 WL 6884084 (9th Cir. Oct. 12, 2022) (Article III standing and statutory standing in TCPA actions)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/18/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive, review, suggest edits to, and note comments regarding, draft petition for writ of certiorari	Ready	550.00 hr	1.10	0.00	1.10	605.00
10/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Wakefield v. Visalus, Inc., -- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 11530386 (9th Cir. Oct. 20, 2022) (post-trial issues in certified TCPA class action, including constitutionality of aggregate award of TCPA damages)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/26/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00

11/30/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider COY EVANS, JEFFREY ADAMS, BERNARD BROWN, ALBERT DUDLEY, MICHAEL GIELLO, et al., Plaintiffs-Appellants, v. OCWEN LOAN SERVICING, LLC, Defendant-Appellee., No. 21-14045, 2022 WL 17259718 (11th Cir. Nov. 29, 2022) (Article III standing under the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/06/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review Defendant's petition for writ of certiorari	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/08/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review order from district court setting status conference (.1); related discussion with MG regarding potential courses of action (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding upcoming conference with court	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft motion to stay case before district court pending petitions to Supreme Court, and make suggested edits.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/20/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Murray v. Grocery Delivery E-Servs. USA Inc., No. 21-1931, 2022 WL 17729630 (1st Cir. Dec. 16, 2022) (incentive awards to named plaintiffs in connection with class settlements)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/22/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Brickman v. United States, No. 21-16785, 2022 WL 17826875 (9th Cir. Dec. 21, 2022) (what constitutes an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Ward v. NPAS, Inc., No. 21-6189, 2023 WL 2624200 (6th Cir. Mar. 24, 2023) (Article III standing)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.40	220.00	0	0.00
04/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding upcoming status hearing and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
04/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with JD regarding upcoming status hearing	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG and JD regarding status hearing with court	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Pucillo v. Nat'l Credit Sys., Inc., No. 21-3131, 2023 WL 3090627 (7th Cir. Apr. 26, 2023) (Article III standing analysis with an analogy to facts underlying Gadelhak v. AT&T Servs., Inc., 950 F.3d 458, 462 (7th Cir. 2020))	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read SHOYON WOODARD, Plaintiff-Appellee, v. KEVIN JOHN O'BRIEN; KEVIN O'BRIEN & ASSOCIATIES CO., LPA, Defendants-Appellants., No. 22-3620, 2023 WL 3399277 (6th Cir. May 9, 2023) (affirming award of attorneys' fees)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/31/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/31/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Dickson v. Direct Energy, LP, No. 22-3394, 2023 WL 3749640 (6th Cir. June 1, 2023) (Article III standing exists for claims under the TCPA based on a single ringless voice message, and related analysis)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review order on attorneys' fees, costs, and fairness of class action settlement	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument before a panel of the 11th Circuit in Susan Drazen, et al. v. Juan Enrique Pinto, Case No. 21-10199 (June 16, 2023) (Article III standing under the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
06/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Hall v. Smosh Dot Com, Inc., No. 22-16216, 2023 WL 4281815 (9th Cir. June 30, 2023) (Article III standing to bring a TCPA claim)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00

07/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review en banc decision in Drazen v. GoDaddy.com, LLC, No. 21-10199 (11th Cir. July 24, 2023) (Article III standing in connection with a TCPA claim)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/26/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review objector's civil appeal statement	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
08/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Trim v. Reward Zone USA LLC, No. 22-55517, 2023 WL 5025264 (9th Cir. Aug. 8, 2023) (what constitutes a prerecorded voice message under the TCPA)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding status of case and appellate mediation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to emails to/from MG, counsel for objector, counsel for Defendant, and 11th Circuit mediator	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Moses v. The New York Times Company, No. 21-cv-2556 (2nd Cir. Aug. 17, 2023) (standards of review for class action settlements, attorneys' fees, and incentive awards under Rule 23(e))	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/22/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails to/from MG, counsel for objector, counsel for Defendant, and mediator, regarding attendance at mediation and related settlement-specific positions	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding case strategy, Mr. Johnson's death, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding case and appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG and JD regarding mediation and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with JD regarding strategy for appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read JJ research regarding communications with absent class members (.2); related emails with litigation team (.1)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with JD regarding named plaintiff-related issues	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
09/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding discussions with counsel for Defendant	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from MG regarding potential substitute named plaintiff (.1); related discussion with MG (.3)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Calls with MG regarding discussions with counsel for objector, mediation, and related appellate issues	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read objector's response to motion to substitute named plaintiff (.2); follow up discussion with MG (.3)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.40	220.00	0	0.00
10/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding mediation-related issues and reply in support of motion to substitute class representative	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/23/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft correct reply in support of motion to substitute class representative, and suggest edits	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/23/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider CLARENCE DAVIS, Plaintiff, v. CAPITAL ONE, N.A., Defendant., No. 122CV00903AJTIDD, 2023 WL 6964051 (E.D. Va. Oct. 20, 2023) (Article III standing under the TCPA, expert analysis, and denial of class certification in wrong number TCPA case)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00

11/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
12/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft declaration of Mr. Fishman (.1); related discussion with MG (.4)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read and note comment regarding draft motion to appoint new class representative	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails to/from MG/counsel for objector regarding motion to appoint new class representative (.2); related discussion with MG (.5); review bankruptcy filing materials from new class representative (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
01/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding status of case and case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review objector's response to motion to substitute name plaintiff, and supporting declaration and exhibits	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding objector's response to motion to substitute named plaintiff, and related strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider DAVID VAN ELZEN, individually & on behalf of all others similarly situated, Plaintiff, v. ADVISORS IGNITE USA LLC, Defendant., No. 22-C-859, 2024 WL 195473 (E.D. Wis. Jan. 18, 2024) (Article III standing in the context of a request to certify a TCPA non-consent class)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, suggest edits to, and note comments regarding, draft reply in support of motion to substitute class representative	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
01/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/25/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive, review, and make suggested edits to draft notice in response to February 9, 2024 order (.9); related discussion with MG (.3)	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review latest draft of response (.3); discuss same with MG and JD (.3).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with JD regarding notice in response to the court's February 9, 2023 order, and related issues	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read order granting motion to appoint new class representative (.2); related discussion with JD (.2); released discussion with MG (.4)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
02/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding mediation-related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and suggest edits to draft mediation statement	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
04/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding upcoming mediation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding upcoming mediation	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG and JD regarding mediation, and related case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00

05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Drazen v. Pinto, No. 21-10199, 2024 WL 2122466 (11th Cir. May 13, 2024) (Motion for Final Approval of Class Action Settlement; Request or Application for Class Certification; Motion for Attorney's Fees)	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read, suggest edits to, and note comments regarding, draft response brief on appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding response brief on appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding status of case	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding status of case and case strategy	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with MG regarding objector's reply brief on appeal	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's brief on appeal, and strategy re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review September 11, 2024 order from the 11th Circuit (.2); call with MG regarding order from 11th Circuit, and related strategy (.2)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/07/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, suggest edits to, and note comments regarding draft response to motion to publish Eleventh Circuit opinion	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy discussion with MG re next steps after denial of motion to publish opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with litigation team regarding status of case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
Total Labor For Aaron Radbil						105.60	10,395.00	86.70	47,685.00
Total Expense For Aaron Radbil								0.00	0.00
Total For Aaron Radbil									47,685.00

Alexander Kruzyk

07/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy discussion with entire firm re: state of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
07/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed discovery responses from defendant (0.4), organizing notes for what will and will not be produced (1.7) and reviewed procedure for filing motion to compel (0.2)	Ready	450.00 hr	2.30	0.00	2.30	1,035.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed plaintiff's and defendant's call log discovery to identify all communications between plaintiff and NPAS(0.9). Created chart of entries for MG to review (0.2).	Ready	450.00 hr	1.10	0.00	1.10	495.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with client re: introduction and discussion of current state of case, and response to subpoena from MetroPCS.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	135.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Meet and confer conference with opposing counsel re: status of discovery responses.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	315.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy discussion with entire firm re: state of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
07/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current state of case and strategy with entire firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
08/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed call logs from TMobile, excerpted calls between plaintiff and TMobile, and circulated to MG.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	315.00
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy discussion with entire firm re: current state of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
08/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed discovery requests from Defendant to Plaintiff.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	135.00
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with potential experts re: scheduling and plans for expert declarations.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	90.00

08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with entire firm re: current state of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
08/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed discovery requests in anticipation of drafting discovery responses.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	270.00
08/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Outlined draft of discovery responses and objections, and consideration of various requests for information and documents.	Ready	450.00 hr	2.10	0.00	2.10	945.00
08/16/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed and finalized draft of discovery responses for plaintiff Johnson.	Ready	450.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	675.00
08/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of state of case and strategy with entire firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current state of case and case strategy with entire firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current state of case and case strategy with entire firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed call log data from produced discovery and ran excel scripts to extract out approximation of class size.	Ready	450.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,125.00
10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conference call with entire firm re: case strategy and current state of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with entire firm re: case strategy and state of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of settlement negotiations and outstanding issues with partners.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	135.00
11/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current status of case and next strategic steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
12/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call to entire office re: state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current state of case and next steps in litigation.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case and next steps in remaining litigation with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case with firm and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of current state of case with firm and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/31/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with firm re: state of litigation and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
02/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of case with entire office, as well as next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
02/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of state of case and next steps, with entire firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
02/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
02/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case with entire office, including next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed class member objection (0.3) and discussed objection response with MG (0.2).	Ready	450.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	225.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Researched prior Davis objections to other class settlements and reviewed briefing and final outcomes re: same.	Ready	450.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	675.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Created exhibit comparing Davis objections in Godiva case and instant case.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	90.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Drafted summary of prior objection history of objector counsel Davis.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	135.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed dockets and orders circulated by JD re: John Davis objection history and additional cases.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	270.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with rest of office re: current state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
03/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Researched changes to Rule 23 specific to changes to treatment of objectors.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	315.00
03/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare portion of motion for final approval regarding objection.	Ready	450.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	720.00
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed and edited all filings in support of approval and fee award	Ready	450.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,125.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed case cites to ensure accurate citations for final approval papers.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	180.00
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
04/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed Davis objection and related filings in Medtronics case (0.3) and discussed significance with MG (0.2).	Ready	450.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	225.00
05/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG re: final approval hearing and preparation.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	90.00
05/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case with rest of firm, and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
05/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
05/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	90.00	0	0.00
05/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with rest of firm re: current state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
07/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.30	135.00	0	0.00
08/15/2018	Johnson,	NPAS	Discussion of case and next steps with rest of	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00

	Charles T. Johnson, Charles T.	Solutions NPAS Solutions	firm. Discussed state of case with rest of firm and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
08/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussed state of case with rest of firm and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
08/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Researched cases discussing underdeveloped records supporting final approval orders in class settlements.	Ready	450.00 hr	1.90	0.00	1.90	855.00
08/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed briefing re: underdeveloped record arguments made by objector opposing final approval.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	180.00
09/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
09/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Researched circuit level cases discussing thoroughness of district court final approval orders for favorable decisions in opposition to objector appeal.	Ready	450.00 hr	4.90	0.00	4.90	2,205.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	90.00	0	0.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.30	135.00	0	0.00
10/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of current state of case with rest of firm and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of state of case with rest of firm, and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
11/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call to discuss current state of case and next steps with rest of firm.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
03/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with rest of firm re: state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
06/19/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
07/09/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: next steps in settlement and resolution of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
09/04/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/10/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/16/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of appeal and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
11/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in litigation.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
01/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
03/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team regarding state of case and next steps for resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
04/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of settlement and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
04/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in resolution of appeal.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of settlement of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps in preparation.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
05/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: appeal of settlement and next steps in preparing argument.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal and next steps in preparation.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
06/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Mock oral argument in preparation of 11th Circuit appeal with MG and rest of litigation team.	Ready	450.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	585.00
06/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps in preparation.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Observed telephonic oral argument in Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	360.00
06/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal and next steps in resolution of case.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
07/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps moving forward.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Reviewed local rules to determine timeline for filing petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	450.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	135.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of case and next steps in appeal and en banc review.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps in resolution.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with litigation team re: state of appeal of case and next steps in resolution of appeal.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	45.00	0	0.00
Total Labor For Alexander Kruzyk						38.40	3,240.00	31.20	14,040.00
Total Expense For Alexander Kruzyk								0.00	0.00
Total For Alexander Kruzyk									14,040.00

James Davidson

04/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to invoice from process server.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
----------------------------	---------------------	----------------	---	-------	------	------	-------	---	------

04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text order on defendant's motion for extension of time to respond to complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review defendant's motion to dismiss and accompanying documents.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft response in opposition to Defendant's motion to dismiss.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review defendant's initial disclosures.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Litigation strategy discussion with JJ, MG and AR.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review defendant's motion to strike class allegations in amended complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text order denying motion to strike.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting motion for extension to select mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from defense counsel re mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Litigation strategy discussion with AR, MG and JJ.	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
06/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from defense counsel re mediators.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conduct research regarding defendant's proposed mediators.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review answer and affirmative defenses to amended complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review defendant's responses and objections to plaintiff's first set of discovery.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy discussion with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review subpoena response from T-Mobile.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review defendant's first set of discovery to Plaintiff.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's Amended Responses and Objections to Plaintiff's Request for Production and Interrogatories.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review unopposed motion for protective order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to correspondence from expert.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from defense counsel with document production.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting in part and denying in part motion for extension of time.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's request for production of documents from Plaintiff's expert.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Litigation strategy with AR and MG.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on draft demand letter.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review estimate from KCC for notice and claims administration.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Settlement strategy with AR and MG (.1); review draft term sheet (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Begin reviewing and revising draft class action settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue reviewing and commenting on settlement agreement and related documents, including proposed class notices.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.00	0.00	2.00	1,100.00
11/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to invoice form expert.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order staying case.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/08/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue reviewing and commenting on motion for preliminary approval and preliminary approval	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00

order.

11/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Defendant's proposed revisions to settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final version of claim form and website notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails with administrator re claim form.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from settlement administrator re results from reverse lookups of telephone numbers associated with potential settlement class members.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from claims administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review defendant's notice of CAFA compliance.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft publication notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consideration of IVR script for use by settlement class members when calling toll-free administration telephone number.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from settlement administrator with settlement website link.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/18/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from settlement administrator re claims website.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/31/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from claims administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from California AG's office in response to CAFA notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review status report from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from claims administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review ACA International opinion, and consideration of potential impacts.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objection and strategy with MG re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conduct research regarding objector and counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on motion for final approval, motion for attorney's fees, declaration in support, and response to Dickenson objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.10	0.00	2.10	1,155.00
04/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review revise declaration from settlement administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review email from objector's counsel and motion for sanctions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final approval order from Godiva and related emails.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails and order re objector sanctions order in other proceeding.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00

05/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG and JJ re final approval hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final order and judgment.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
06/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review research regarding appellate bonds.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails with AR and MG re phone call with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
08/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's opening brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with MG.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with MG.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on opposition brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.80	0.00	1.80	990.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review NPAS's opposition to objector's brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to invoice from Lex Group.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on notice of supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
10/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's reply brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/19/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re phone call with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/04/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/08/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector letter to 11th circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/16/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team re case update.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/04/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument to appeal.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument on appeal.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re objector's notice of supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Objector's additional supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate hearing.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with class member C. Rodriguez.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG and AR client incentive award.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting telephonic hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from MG re 11th Cir. panel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeals hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellate materials and then participate in mock oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.80	0.00	1.80	990.00
06/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument (.8); follow up discussion with MG and JJ (.4)	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
06/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with MG and then meeting with MG and client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Supreme Court opinion in Barr re constitutionality of TCPA, and consideration of impact on case and future proceedings.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
08/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/31/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Exchange of correspondence with R. Atkins re inquiry into settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order reversing in part final approval order then discuss same with JSJ.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss with litigation team re responding to reporter inquiries.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with J. Streisfeld re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR and MG re hearing en banc; phone calls re en banc hearing strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.80	0.00	1.80	990.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re en banc review strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/24/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re appeal status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re extension to file en banc petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's motion for extension of time to file petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/01/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Objector's Bill of Costs.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/14/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review of draft en banc petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on en banc petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review brief of respondent to the United States Supreme Court in Duguid v. Facebook, Inc., No. 19-511, re statutory interpretation of term "automatic telephone dialing system" under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
10/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re cases status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review MOTION OF PROFESSOR WILLIAM B. RUBENSTEIN FOR LEAVE TO FILE AMICUS CURIAE BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF-APPELLEE'S PETITION FOR REHEARING EN BANC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Rubenstein amicus brief in support of motion for en banc review of legality of service awards for class representatives.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/02/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order dismissing TCPA claims due to lack of subject matter jurisdiction as a result of Barr in Lidenbaum v. Realgy (N.D. Ohio Oct. 29, 2020), and consideration of potential impact.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
11/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read briefs of Impact Fund and 14 Non-Profit Legal and Advocacy Organizations, Charles N. Nauen for The Committee to Support the Antitrust Laws, Public Justice and Main Street Alliance in support of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
11/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting leave to file amicus submissions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order withholding mandate.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review reply brief in Duguid v. Facebook case before Supreme Court re meaning of ATDS.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/21/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Rieker v. National Car Cure, LLC, No. 3:20-cv-05901-TKW-HTC (Article III standing under the TCPA, rejecting Creasy and Lindenbaum).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying motion to dismiss in Less v. Quest, No. 3:20-2546 (N.D. OH) re constitutionality of TCPA pre-AAPC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/08/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review McCurley v. Royal Sea Cruises, No. 17-cv-00986-BAS-AGS, 2021 WL 312005 (S.D. Cal. Jan. 29, 2021) (TCPA opinion re vicarious liability).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/09/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Jackson v. Regions Bank, 2021 WL 754836 (7th Cir. 2021) (TCPA opinion).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/15/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Massaro v. Beyond Meat, Inc., No.: 3:20-cv-00510-AJB-MSB, 2021 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 46980 (C.D. Cal. Mar. 1, 2021) and Boisvert v. Carnival Corporation, No: 8:20-cv-2076-30SPF (M.D. Fla. Mar. 12, 2021) (constitutionality of autodialer provision post-AAPC).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Facebook, Inc. v. Duguid, et al., No. 19-511 (April 1, 2021) (definition of an automatic telephone dialing system).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR and MG re supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/19/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Response to Supplemental Authority (28J) filed by Appellant Jenna Dickenson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/27/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Van Connor v. One Life, No. 6:19-cv-03283-DCC, 2021 WL 2667063 (D. S.C. Jun. 29, 2021) (order denying Creasy motion).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from A. Keller.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying rehearing en banc, and discussion with litigation team re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from S. Gant re potential Supreme Court cert. petition.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re strategy re potential cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR and MG re Supreme Court cert. petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re Supreme Court cert. petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with AR and MG re petition to Supreme Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Supreme Court cert petition strategy with MG.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re class cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re class cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/23/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting preliminary approval to wrong number TCPA class action settlement in Miles v. Medcredit, Inc., No. 4:20-cv-1186-JAR (E.D. Mo. Aug. 23, 2022).	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/30/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Kelly v. RealPage, Inc., --- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 3642113 (Aug. 24, 2022) re Article III standing and ascertainability standard on motion for class certification.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Shirley v. Rocket Mortgage, No. 2:21-cv-13007, (E.D. Mich. July 7, 2022) (granting motion to compel arbitration in TCPA case) (.2); review Thrower v. Citizens Disability, LLC, No. 20-10285, 2022 WL 3754737 (D. Mass. Aug. 30, 2022) granting class certification in TCPA case) (.2); Hyland v. Navient, No. 20-3765 (2nd Cir. Sept. 7, 2022) allowing class action incentive awards (.3).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
10/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Wakefield v. Visalus, Inc., -- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 11530386 (9th Cir. Oct. 20, 2022) (TCPA class action including constitutionality of aggregate award of TCPA damages.).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/25/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Petition to Supreme Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/26/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/26/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Application (22A343) to extend the time to file a petition for a writ of certiorari from October 22, 2022 to December 21, 2022, submitted to Justice Thomas.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/15/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Adler v. All Hours Plumbing Drain Cleaning 24-7-365 LLC, No. 2:21-CV-00141, 2022 WL 15513196 (D. Utah Oct. 27, 2022) (certifying TCPA class action over objection).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Borden v. eFinancial, LLC, --- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 16955661 (9th Cir. Nov. 16, 2022), regarding definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/30/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review EVANS v. OCWEN LOAN SERVICING, LLC, No. 21-14045, 2022 WL 17259718, at *1 (11th	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

Cir. Nov. 29, 2022), regarding Article III standing for TCPA claims.

12/06/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's cert. petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/08/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review PAPERLESS ORDER SETTING STATUS CONFERENCE on Eleventh Circuit's remand.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence with E. Issacson re district court stay.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review motion to stay.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order staying case.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Dickenson response to cert. petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/23/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Murray v. Grocery E-Services (1st Cir. Dec. 16, 2022) (affirming class action incentive award).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR to discuss cert. petition denial.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re cert. petition denial, next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/21/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from C. Cooper re Zoom info. for status conference.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG and then phone call with MG and AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re final approval.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to J. Davis with cost check.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Williams v. PillPack LLC, No. 3:19-CV-05282-DGE, 2023 WL 2573356 (W.D. Wash. Mar. 20, 2023) (Rule 23 notice in TCPA class actions and sufficiency reverse lookups).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/31/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order on remand.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/21/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument in Drazen, et al. v. Juan Enrique Pinto, Case No. 21-10199 (June 16, 2023) (Article III standing under the TCPA).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
06/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Hall v. Smosh Dot Com, Inc., 2023 WL 4281815 (9th Cir. Jun. 30, 2023) (whether owner of phone has Article III standing in TCPA case).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of civil appeal docketed with deadlines.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Drazen v. GoDaddy.com, LLC, No. 21-10199 (11th Cir. July 24, 2023) (Article III standing in connection with a TCPA claim).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Delagarza: Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's Civil Appeal Statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare, finalize and file appearance of counsel form.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's certificate of interested parties.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review briefing schedule on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence with mediator regarding client appearances.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Moses v. The New York Times Company, No. 21-cv-2556 (2nd Cir. Aug. 17, 2023) (standard of review of class action settlement under Rule 23(e)).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/22/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text entry re 30-Day Over the phone extension granted by clerk as to Attorney John W. Davis for Appellant Jenna Dickenson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/30/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on draft meditation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence re client and then exchange of emails with MG re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re client death.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re client death.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review cases regarding death of plaintiff on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG and AR re mediation and class plaintiffs.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JJ re research project then review notice of cancellation of mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JJ re research on contacting class members.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from E. Issacson re rescheduled mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re new plaintiff.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review research and cases from JJ re contacting class members of a certified class.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re potential new client then review draft email to potential client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on suggestion of death.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from M. Monaghan.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of rescheduled mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MG re parameters for potential settlement framework.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's opposition to motion to substitute.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from mediator to reschedule mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status and strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re settlement/mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conduct research regarding Rule 43 (1.2); then phone call with MG re same (.4).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	880.00
10/12/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on reply ISO motion to substitute.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Huber v. Simon's Agency, --- F.4th ---, 2023 WL 6629836 (3d Cir. Oct. 12, 2023) (Article III standing and class certification).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review settlement proposal from objector and draft response.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

10/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review deficiency notice re reply brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/22/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Samson v. United Healthcare, No. 2:19-CV-00175, 2023 WL 6793973 (W.D. Wash. Oct. 13, 2023) (certifying wrong number TCPA class).	Ready	0 hr	0.40	220.00	0	0.00
10/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Davis v. Capital One, N.A., 2023 WL 6964051 (E.D. Va. Oct. 20, 2023) (denying certification in wrong number class action).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
11/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
12/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
12/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review paperless order re motion to substitute.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on draft client declaration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft status report.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on draft motion to substitute party and then phone call with MG.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
01/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review revised draft of motion to appoint Charles Fishman as class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re motion to substitute plaintiff.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re objector opposition, and strategy re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Van Elzen v. Advisors Ignite USA LLC, 2024 WL 195473 (E.D. Wis. Jan. 18, 2024) (denying motion for class certification on standing grounds in proposed class action under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's opposition to motion to substitute Fishman as class representative (.1); then phone call with MG re same (.4).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
01/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on draft reply ISO to appoint Charles Fishman as class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
01/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft status report to Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order re motion for substitution of plaintiff.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and re-review response to court order re client passing (.3); then two phone calls with MG re same (.8).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.10	0.00	1.10	605.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on latest versions of response to February 9, 2024 order to court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG and AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JJ re notice to court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
02/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order substituting new class representative (.1); phone call with AR re order substituting class counsel (.2); then phone call with MG re same (.4).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
02/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting briefing schedule.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of zoom mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

02/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Appellant's opening brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status and response to second appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/15/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review In re Wawa, Inc. Data Sec. Litig., No. 2:19-cv-06019-GEKP (E.D. Pa.) (calculation of attorneys' fees in class action settlement).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR and MG re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
04/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
05/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Soliman v. Subway Franchisee Advertising Fund Trust, Ltd., --- F.4th ----, 2024 WL 2097361 (2d Cir. May 10, 2024) (what constitutes an ATDS under the TCPA).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Drazen v. GoDaddy.com, LLC, --- F.4th --- -, 2024 WL 2122466 (11th Cir. May 13, 2024) addressing approval and class notice of class action settlement under Telephone Consumer Protection Act).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
05/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on Mr. Fishman's draft response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.70	0.00	1.70	935.00
05/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
06/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Drazen v GoDaddy.com, LLC, 2024 WL 3422404 (11th Cir. July 16, 2024).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's reply brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Payne v. Sieva Networks, Inc., 2024 WL 3585119 (N.D. Cal. July 29, 2024) (granting motion to deny class certification).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
08/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order vacating district court's opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
10/07/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and comment on draft opposition to motion to publish opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
10/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying motion to publish.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text order requiring submission of briefing schedule.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with MG re call with objectors counsel (.2); then phone call with AR and MG re same (.3).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00

11/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review motion to set briefing schedule.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review PAPERLESS ORDER granting [96] Motion to Set Briefing Schedule.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
11/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
Total Labor For James Davidson						85.50	8,580.00	69.90	38,445.00
Total Expense For James Davidson								0.00	0.00
Total For James Davidson									38,445.00

Jesse Johnson

03/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of complaint and assignment of judges	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review motion for extension of time	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting in part and denying in part extension request	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review DC's NOAs	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review article in Florida Record re: lawsuit	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of joint scheduling report	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of amended complaint	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise opposition to Defendant's motion to dismiss.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
05/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying MTD as moot	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Defendant's initial disclosures	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of scheduling order	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ JLD, MLG, AR	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Def's motion to strike and consideration of response to same.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence w/ DC re: mediators	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying motion to strike	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
06/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence w/ DC re: mediators	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
06/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review recent ND W.Va opinion certifying TCPA class	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
06/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ AR, JLD, MLG	Ready	0 hr	0.30	150.00	0	0.00
06/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of selection of mediator	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
07/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review T-Mobile subpoena response	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
07/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Sussino v. Work Out World decision from 3rd Circuit finding standing to bring TCPA claims consistent with Spokeo decision	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
07/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
07/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence w/ DC re: conferring over written discovery responses	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
07/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review recent 11th Cir. authority on revocation of consent under TCPA	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
08/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review recent 3d Cir. decision in City Select Auto Sales v. BMW re: ascertainability in the context of TCPA class litigation	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
08/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filings of PHV motions for DC	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
08/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of agreed protective order	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
08/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review orders granting PHV admissions	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Pltff's expert report	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
08/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order entering agreed protective order	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of joint MOT for extension of time	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise settlement demand letter	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
10/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to Plaintiff's production of documents in response to written discovery requests.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00

10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice and administration estimate from KCC for potential settlement class	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review class cert. briefing in Cook v. PRA action in MD Fla re: certifying TCPA wrong number class	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
11/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order staying case in light of settlement	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise Pltff's prelim approval MOT and MLG supporting decl.	Ready	500.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	650.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of Pltff's prelim approval MOT	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order preliminarily approving class settlement	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of notice of CAFA compliance	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from KCC re: reverse looks up for class members	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/18/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review publication of class notice	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
01/31/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review status report from KCC	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
02/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call w/ class member T. Robinson to answer questions about settlement	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
02/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review claims update from KCC	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
02/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from claims admin.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
02/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Cir.'s decision in Romero confirming Article III standing for TCPA violations	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
03/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review claims update from KCC	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
03/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review claims update from KCC	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of objection & discuss w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review scholarship from defense bar on DC Cir's ruling in ACA Int'l and likely defense arguments to be seen should settlement be undone	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review DC Cir's decision in ACA Int'l appeal of 2015 FCC Order re: ATDS definition, one-call safe harbor, and health care exemption for TCPA liability	Ready	500.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	600.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss objector response strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review latest claims update from KCC	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re: oppositions to objection filed by Pltff and Def	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of Pltff's MOT for final approval, fee petition, and response to objections	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of Def's response to objections	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from J. Davis re: withdrawal of Pltff's response to his client's objection to settlement (.2); discuss same w/ team (.1)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
04/18/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review scholarship from Nat'l Consumer Law Center on the effects of D.C. Cir's decision in ACA	Ready	500.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	350.00

			Int'l, which includes strategy for addressing likely arguments from TCPA defendants re: ATDS scope and consent						
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of J. Dickenson's supplemental affidavit re: calls from NPAS	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Travel to/from & attend final fairness hearing	Ready	500.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,750.00
05/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final order and judgment	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
06/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of objector's NOT of appeal	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
07/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
07/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to MLG notice of appearance in 11th Cir.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's appellate brief & discuss w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from MLG to mediator & appellate counsel	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
08/22/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call w/ class member Simone M. regarding status of settlement	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
08/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Douglas v. Western Union order on TCPA settlement final approval & class counsel's fee petition	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
09/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise Appellant's response brief	Ready	500.00 hr	1.90	0.00	1.90	950.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of Pltff/Apellee's appellate brief	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
09/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Cir's decision in Marks v. Crunch Fitness holdings predictive dialers to be ATDS	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
09/25/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review MD Fla TCPA/ATDS summary judgment decision in Glasser v. Hilton Grand Vacations	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
10/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Cir.'s order in Muransky v. Godvia appeal, and discuss same w/ team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.20	100.00	0	0.00
10/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss lit. strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review SD Fla MTD decision adopting 9th Cir.'s Marks decision to include predictive dialers w/in statutory definition of ATDS	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
11/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellant's reply brief	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
11/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review SD Fla's decision certifying TCPA class in Keim v. Pizza Hut	Ready	500.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	300.00
12/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review scholarship on latest guidance from FCC re: reassigned number database	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
12/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review latest order from FCC re: recycled number database, and review scholarship on same	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
03/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/10/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss case strategy w/ team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/03/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 2d Cir's recent decision in Melito v. American Eagle confirming TCPA standing for plaintiffs	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
06/19/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion w/ lit. team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
06/20/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review recent Supreme Court decision in PDR Network v. Carlton & Harris re: applicability of Hobbs Act to FCC orders re: interpretation of TCPA's provisions	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
09/10/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review recent ND Cal decision in Berman v. Freedom Financial re: reasonable reliance defense in TCPA action, and class cert. issues w/ class members subject to mandatory arbitration provisions	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
10/07/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of suppl. authority in 11th Circuit	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00

10/16/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion w/ lit. team re: objector appeal	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/18/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Supreme Court petition in Facebook litigation concerning constitutionality of TCPA and breadth of ATDS provisions	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
11/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion w/ lit. team re: call to 11th Cir. clerk	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: client	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review ED Pa's decision in Ward v. Flagship denying final approval of TCPA settlement and expressing concerns over size of settlement fund in comparison to defendant's resources, lack of formal discovery on merits of case, size of fee award request, and choice for cy pres recipient	Ready	500.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	300.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: scheduling of appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: potential oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/07/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 2nd Circuit's decision in Duran v. La Boom Disco re: interpretation of TCPA's automatic telephone dialing system provision (.3), and discuss with litigation team (.1)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
04/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: potential response to objector's notice of supplemental authority	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting oral argument calendar	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of calendar acknowledgment for MLG	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy for appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/01/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of supplemental authority by objector	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to Supreme Court oral argument in Barr v. American Assoc. of Political Consultants re: constitutionality of TCPA	Ready	500.00 hr	1.10	0.00	1.10	550.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review industry media coverage on Supreme Court oral argument in Barr case addressing TCPA constitutionality	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
05/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of telephonic oral argument, and discuss same with litigation team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
05/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss appellate panel and related strategy with litigation team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument and allocation of time between Plaintiff's counsel and defense counsel	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
06/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review & annotate appellate briefing in prep for mock oral argument for MLG	Ready	500.00 hr	2.20	0.00	2.20	1,100.00
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument, and following argument, discuss results with MLG, JLD	Ready	500.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	650.00
06/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate oral argument results	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
06/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's notice of supplemental authority	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
07/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Supreme Court's decision in Barr re: constitutionality of TCPA	Ready	500.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	400.00
07/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 6th Circuit's decision joining 2nd and 9th Circuits in holding that automatic dialing from a stored list constitutes ATDS usage under the TCPA	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
08/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate matter	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review U.S. government's response supporting Facebook in Supreme Court case over proper interpretation of TCPA	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Circuit's order vacating and remanding settlement approval (.5); discuss same with litigation team and steps moving forward (.1)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	300.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate ruling, and strategy for petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review local rules for purposes of deadline for submission of petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from Boies Schiller attorneys re: petition for rehearing, and discuss with litigation team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team re: responses to media inquiries over appellate ruling	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone calls with AR (.2) and MLG (.5) to discuss strategy for petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	350.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple phone calls with MLG to discuss strategy for petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	400.00

09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team Re: petition for en banc review	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
09/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy for petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
09/24/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Lit. strategy with team re: petition for rehearing en banc, and potential extension	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
09/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's motion for extension of time to file petition for rehearing, and court's order granting same	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of objector's motion for extension of time to file petition for rehearing	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy for Plaintiff's petition for rehearing	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
10/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: motion for rehearing en banc	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellees' petition for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
10/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellant's motion for rehearing en banc	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: notices of appearance in appellate matter	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Professor Rubenstein's amicus brief	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
11/02/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Circuit's decision in Muransky v. Godiva declining jurisdiction over plaintiff's consumer protection statutory violations	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
11/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting leave to file amicus briefs in support of rehearing en banc	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order withholding mandate, and discuss with litigation team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
11/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Correspondence with class member R. Atkins re: appeal status	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
11/24/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellate briefing in Facebook v. Duguid Supreme Court case re: scope of definition of ATDS.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
12/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review oral arguments in Duguid v. Facebook Supreme Court case re: definition of ATDS	Ready	500.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	400.00
05/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review letter to 11th Cir. clerk re: supplemental authority	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review motion by T. Lenkner to withdraw as counsel	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order approving withdrawal of counsel	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying rehearing en banc, and discussion with litigation team and co-counsel re: next steps	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review press on rehearing decision, and discussion with litigation team re: appeal to Supreme Court	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
08/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: cert. petition to Supreme Court	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Cir. decision in Chennette v. Proch.com confirming constitutional and statutory standing for TCPA plaintiffs	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
10/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order vacating order to withhold mandate	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/18/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft cert. petition to Supreme Court	Ready	500.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	350.00
10/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: draft cert. petition	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Cir.'s decision in Wakefield v. ViSalus confirming standing for TCPA claims, denying post-trial motion to assert consent defense, and remanding for constitutional analysis for damages award	Ready	0 hr	0.40	200.00	0	0.00
10/25/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellant's bill of costs and discuss with litigation team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/26/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order extending time for objector to file for cert., and discuss with litigation team	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/18/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Cir. decision in Borden v. Efinancial affirming dismissal of ATDS TCPA claim	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
12/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: objector's petition for cert. to Supreme Court	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/08/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting status conference	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order rescheduling status conference	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of E. Issacson's motion for admission PHV	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying E. Isaacson PHV request	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting E. Isaacson appearance PHV	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise Plaintiff's unopposed motion to stay case	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
12/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order staying case	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/20/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Reuters press about Supreme Court petition for cert.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: Supreme Court petitions	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/22/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 1st Cir. decision in Murray v. HelloFresh approving of incentive awards in TCPA class	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00

			settlement							
02/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: preparation of opposition to objector's cert. petition	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
02/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: opposition to objector's cert petition	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
04/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: Supreme Court denying cert. petition, strategy for requesting supplemental briefing in front of district court	Ready	0 hr	0.40	200.00	0	0.00	
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of denial of writ of certiorari (.1); discuss strategy with litigation team re: potential supplemental briefing (.1)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting status conference	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
05/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: results of status conference	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
06/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review district court order on remand from 11th Cir.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
06/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: order on remand finally approving settlement	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
06/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: potential appeal by objector	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's notice of appeal	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: objector's new appeal and strategy moving forward	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review MLG appearance in new appeal	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appearance by John Davis for objector in appeal	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review docketing in 11th Cir. of new objector appeal	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Cir. decision in Drazen v. GoDaddy confirming Article III standing for TCPA claim	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
07/26/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: initial filings in 11th Cir.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of appearance by E. Isaacson for objector	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
07/31/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of objector's civil appeal statement and transcript information form	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
08/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: preparation of Plaintiff's certificate of interested persons	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Cir. appearance by JLD	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appearance of counsel by M. Monaghan	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
08/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy for mediation	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00	
08/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: mediation correspondence from objector's counsel	Ready	0 hr	0.20	100.00	0	0.00	
08/22/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting extension of time for appellant's brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review case law research on FRAP 43 and FRCP 25 re: substitution of class representatives, in preparation for group discussion	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00	
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate strategy	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00	
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MLG, litigation team re: potential substitute class representatives.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00	
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with MLG re: research findings	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research case law re: communications between class counsel and absent class members	Ready	500.00 hr	5.30	0.00	5.30	2,650.00	
09/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JLD re: research findings on contacting absent class members	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00	
09/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue to research case law re: communications with absent class members who may wish to serve as class representatives, and prepare correspondence with findings for litigation team	Ready	500.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,750.00	
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue researching case law regarding communications with absent class members who express interest in becoming substitute class representatives	Ready	500.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	800.00	
09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: potential substitution of class representative	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discuss new plaintiff with MLG, and review correspondence from new plaintiff	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise Suggestion of Death of Plaintiff and Motion to Substitute	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00	
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research appellate decisions granting substitution of parties	Ready	500.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	450.00	
09/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: motion to substitute	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: conferral with defense counsel over substitution of class representative	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from defense counsel re: non-opposition to substitution of class rep.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00	
09/28/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of suggestion of death of appellee and motion to substitute class representative	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00	
10/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's opposition to motion to substitute appellee	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00	

10/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from mediator	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy for reply in support of motion for substitution	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
10/12/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft reply brief in support of substitution and discuss revisions with litigation team	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
10/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Third Circuit's decision in Huber v. Simon's re: individual and class standing for consumer protection statutory causes of action (.3), and discuss same with litigation team (.1)	Ready	0 hr	0.40	200.00	0	0.00
10/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review latest draft of Plaintiff's reply in support of substitution (.2), and discuss strategy for same with litigation team (.2)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
10/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: objector's settlement proposal	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: re-filing reply brief in support of substitution, upcoming mediation	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
11/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: settlement discussions with objector's counsel	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: upcoming appellate mediation	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: upcoming mediation conference	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
12/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: order remanding case to district court for class representative substitution	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
12/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting deadline for Plaintiff's motion to substitute class reps	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of motion to substitute lead plaintiff	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: motion to substitute Fishman	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
01/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: impending opposition from objector to motion to substitute class reps	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's opposition to Plaintiff's motion to substitute class rep.	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
01/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: briefing on motion to substitute class representative	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
01/25/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's reply in support of motion to substitute class representative	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
01/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: briefing on motion to substitute class representative	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's status report to 11th Cir.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order for additional briefing (.1); discuss order within JLD (.4)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise notice to court re: Johnson death (.4); and discussion with litigation team re: edits (.2)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	300.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review latest draft of Plaintiff's notice (.2), and discuss same with MLG (.3)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	250.00
02/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: Plaintiff's notice in response to court order	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order substituting class representative (.2), and discussion with litigation team re: same (.2)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
02/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: order appointing new class representative	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting appellate briefing schedule	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice setting appellate mediation	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
02/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate mediation strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: preparation of mediation statement	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: upcoming mediation and objector's impending brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's opening appellate brief (.5), and discuss with litigation team (.1)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	300.00
04/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: objector's appellate brief, upcoming appellate mediation strategy	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
04/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of appellate appendix	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting extension for Plaintiff's appellate response brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: Plaintiff's mediation statement and upcoming mediation	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector counsel re: mediation	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
04/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: results of appellate mediation	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
04/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate briefing strategy	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate briefing	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
05/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy for appellate brief	Ready	0 hr	0.20	100.00	0	0.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with MLG re: Plaintiff's appellate response brief	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00

05/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: preparation of appellate response brief	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
05/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise Plaintiff's appellate response brief	Ready	500.00 hr	1.70	0.00	1.70	850.00
05/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing of Plaintiff's appellate response brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
06/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate briefing	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
06/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting extension of time for appellant's reply brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
06/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: extension of time for objector's reply brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
06/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appellate briefing	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's appellate reply brief	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
07/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: objector's reply brief	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
07/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise Plaintiff's 28j letter	Ready	500.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	200.00
08/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: Plaintiff's response to objector's 28j letter	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: appeal status	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
09/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Circuit order vacating fee award (.1), and discuss same with MLG (.2)	Ready	500.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	150.00
09/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellant's motion for publication of decision	Ready	500.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	100.00
10/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's opposition to motion for publication of appellate opinion	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
10/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: Plaintiff's opposition to motion to publish	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: briefing on objector's motion for publication of appellate opinion	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: briefing on motion to publish decision	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
10/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: order on motion to publish opinion	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review issuance of appellate mandate.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: issuance of mandate to district court	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: strategy discussion for potential submission to district court	Ready	0 hr	0.20	100.00	0	0.00
11/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order for proposed briefing schedule	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Plaintiff's unopposed motion to set briefing schedule	Ready	500.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	50.00
11/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting briefing schedule	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
11/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re: agreed briefing before district court	Ready	0 hr	0.10	50.00	0	0.00
Total Labor For Jesse Johnson						78.80	7,950.00	62.90	31,450.00
Total Expense For Jesse Johnson								0.00	0.00
Total For Jesse Johnson									31,450.00

Michael Greenwald									
03/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Factual research re potential claims; emails with Mr. Johnson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
03/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Mr. Johnson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
03/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Mr. Johnson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare class action complaint; factual research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.90	0.00	1.90	1,045.00
03/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize class action complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
03/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to magistrate consent form and strategy re consent to magistrate.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to service of process.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
03/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re filed complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference and emails with K. Keogh.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
04/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's notices of appearance.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's motion for extension of time to respond to complaint, and proposed order re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting in part and denying in part Defendant's motion for extension of time to respond to complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's additional notices of appearance.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re due date for response to complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review scheduling order and attention to deadlines and court's procedures and requirements.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to discovery order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to draft joint scheduling report and proposed order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
05/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare draft Rule 16.1 report and draft proposed schedule.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
05/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to motion to dismiss and strike; strategy re opposition to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
05/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re motion to dismiss.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider proposed changes to proposed scheduling report and scheduling order; discussions with AR re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re proposed changes to proposed scheduling report and scheduling order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Seventh Circuit decision in Blow v. Bijora, Inc. re what constitutes an ATDS and consideration of potential impact on claims.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy discussion with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/08/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/08/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on amended class action complaint, and factual research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	880.00
05/08/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of Defendant's motion to dismiss and strike, and research re options in response.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
05/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise amended class action complaint; prepare correspondence to client re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
05/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize amended complaint.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
05/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Tillman v. Allied Financial decision in Middle District of Florida, and consideration of impact on future class certification motion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare first set of interrogatories and first requests for production of documents.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
05/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re opposition to Defendant's motion to dismiss/strike, and consideration of arguments in response.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.30	0.00	2.30	1,265.00
05/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on opposition to motion to dismiss/strike.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.60	0.00	2.60	1,430.00
05/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying motion to dismiss and strike as moot.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare draft initial disclosures pursuant to Rule 26(a)(1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re account documentation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise initial disclosures.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's initial disclosures.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order awarding treble damages in Dish Network TCPA matter, and consideration of relevance to damages in wrong number, ATDS matters.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review scheduling order and attention to case deadlines.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re scheduling order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy discussion with AR, JD, and JJ.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

05/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's motion to strike; legal research re opposition to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re potential mediators; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying motion to strike.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re order denying motion to strike.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare follow up correspondence to defense counsel re mediator selection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research into mediator proposed by defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review draft joint motion to extend deadline to select mediator and proposed order; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order certifying TCPA class in Mey v. Venture Data, LLC (N.D. W.Va.), and consideration of potential impact on future class certification motion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and mediation strategy discussion with AR, JD, and JJ.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re potential mediators; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
06/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research mediators suggested by Defendant, and discuss with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
06/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to mediator selection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
06/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re mediator selection; review, revise and finalize notice of mediator selection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re mediator selection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's answer, and consideration of Defendant's affirmative defenses.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare subpoena to MetroPCS (0.6); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same (0.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
06/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re MetroPCS subpoena and request for client calling records.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with litigation team.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to Defendant's discovery responses and objections; prepare correspondence to defense counsel pursuant to Rule 37.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
07/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review responses to MetroPCS subpoena, including production of client phone records and subscriber and payment data.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
07/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client and AK regarding response to subpoena and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review case law re form objections to discovery requests and consideration of next discovery steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for discovery meet and confer with defense counsel, and consideration of discovery necessary to support motion for class certification.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attend telephonic meet and confer with defense counsel re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
07/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise proposed confidentiality order; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conference with AR re proposed confidentiality order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re meet and confer, a potential motion to compel, and documents responsive to MetroPCS subpoena.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/01/2017	Johnson,	NPAS	Review correspondence from defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

	Charles T.	Solutions								
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review and consideration of Defendant's written discovery requests, and consideration of responses to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00	
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy with AR, JD, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re Defendant's written discovery requests.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to responses and objections to discovery requests.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
08/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for and attend meet and confer with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00	
08/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Expert witness strategy; prepare correspondence to potential expert witness.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00	
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with expert.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
08/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Circuit decision in Schweitzer v. Comenity Bank re revocation of consent under TCPA.	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00	
08/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Confer with AK re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Circuit's decision in Spokeo II remand, and consideration of Article III standing-related issues.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
08/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's discovery requests to prepare for discovery call with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
08/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with AK and client re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00	
08/17/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Third Circuit's class certification decision in City Select Auto Sales, Inc. v. BMW Bank of North America, Inc. re ascertainability and discovery of call database.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
08/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re revised proposed protective order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consideration of revised version of protective order; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
08/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with expert witness.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
08/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Further review and revise responses and objections to discovery requests.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00	
08/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re responses and objections to discovery requests.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft expert report; discussions with AR re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00	
08/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's motion for entry of protective order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's motions for admission pro hac vice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy AR, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise amended expert report; attention to expert report and methodology for reverse look ups; emails with Rust and KCC re same; multiple emails to and from expert; strategy re finalization of report.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00	
08/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review orders granting admission PHV of defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to finalization of expert report, including review of latest draft and multiple emails with expert.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00	
08/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's amended discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
08/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to Plaintiff's discovery responses and objections; prepare verification for client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
08/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re expert report.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
08/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with KCC re reverse look up of client's cell phone number.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
08/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on discovery responses and objections; prepare correspondence to client re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00	
08/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting agreed protective order; review modifications to proposed order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
09/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re discovery.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
09/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re discovery responses and objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
09/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise discovery responses and objections; emails with client; emails with	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00	

			defense counsel.						
09/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consideration of documents produced by defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.90	0.00	1.90	1,045.00
09/18/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on notice of deposition pursuant to Rule 30(b)(6), and consideration of topics.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
09/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and settlement strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel re scheduling; attention to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/21/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/22/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft joint motion to extend deadlines; emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review discovery requests to expert and consideration of proper scope; prepare correspondence to expert re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
10/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference re settlement strategy with AR and JD.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on settlement demand.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to Defendant's document production.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of draft demand letter.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re settlement demand and authorization.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with client re settlement demand.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise and finalize demand letter to Defendant.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
10/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding expert discovery and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for and attend telephone conference with expert witness re document requests and production.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
10/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to Plaintiff's production of documents in response to written discovery requests.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
10/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails to and from client re document production.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue review of documents for production; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of notice of deposition under Rule 30(b)(6), and consideration of topics for examination.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/11/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft 30(b)(6) deposition notice; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/16/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and discovery strategy discussion with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/16/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re framing of motion for class certification.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding case strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel; internal settlement strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
10/19/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to logistics for potential meeting in New York with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on draft settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.00	0.00	2.00	1,100.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel re potential settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with KCC re estimate for class notice and administration of approximately 180,000 wrong number-coded cellular telephone numbers.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re preliminary and final approval orders from Judge Rosenberg.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
10/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on draft settlement agreement and exhibits, including class notice, website notice, and draft orders of preliminary and final approval.	Ready	550.00 hr	6.50	0.00	6.50	3,575.00
10/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client re settlement counter offer and settlement authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel re settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/23/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Settlement strategy discussions with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00

10/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Travel time for settlement meeting with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	7.80	0.00	7.80	4,290.00
10/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice and administration estimate from KCC; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/24/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for settlement conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conferences with client re settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on draft term sheet; prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Settlement conference calls with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of settlement agreement and notice documents.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
10/25/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with expert witness.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and declaration in support.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.40	0.00	4.40	2,420.00
10/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/26/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re confirmatory discovery.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.90	0.00	2.90	1,595.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise settlement agreement and its exhibits.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	715.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client re settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/30/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to executed term sheet; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/31/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel; emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
11/01/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Preliminary approval and settlement strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise and finalize notice of settlement; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
11/02/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to order re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/03/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with expert witness.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and declaration in support.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.40	0.00	2.40	1,320.00
11/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order vacating case deadlines attention to case calendar.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review of proposed revisions to settlement documents from defense counsel; emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/08/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consideration of redlines of settlement agreement and exhibits from defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
11/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise settlement agreement and exhibits per defense counsel's edits; consideration of same; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re open issues.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
11/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval and declaration in support of same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
11/09/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with AR and JD.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/10/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review of proposed revisions by defense counsel to motion for preliminary approval and declaration in support.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval and declaration in support.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
11/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re notice program.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel re class notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with KCC re class notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and preliminary approval strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/14/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on preliminary approval papers.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise exhibits to settlement agreement; revise settlement agreement to include provision for publication notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel re final revisions to settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00

11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with client re finalization of settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise motion for preliminary approval and declaration in support per JJ edits.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
11/15/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Preliminary approval strategy with AR, JD, and JJ.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/16/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise notice documents with pertinent information from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/16/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re updated notice documents.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/20/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re finalization of settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise preliminary approval motion and declaration in support.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
11/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re signed settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise and finalize motion for preliminary approval and proposed order.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re preliminary approval.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Preliminary approval strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order of preliminary approval and attention to case deadlines; emails with KCC and defense counsel re same and CAFA notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re preliminary approval order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/04/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise notice documents and claim form to reflect dates provided in preliminary approval order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/05/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise notice documents; emails with KCC and defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/06/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC; prepare correspondence to KCC with documents for settlement website.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/07/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re preliminary approval and class notice.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/08/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and provide revisions to settlement website; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/12/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review class list; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/13/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Notice strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/27/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re reverse phone number look ups.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and notice strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re reverse look ups.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/28/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's notice of compliance with CAFA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/29/2017	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails from KCC; attention to draft notice to be published in USA Today.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read and note West v. California Servs. Bureau, Inc., No. 16-CV-3124-YGR, 2017 WL 6316823 (N.D. Cal. Dec. 11, 2017) (certifying a wrong-number TCPA class over the defendant's objection)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise publication notice; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Notice strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise script for toll-free IVR for settlement class members to obtain information about settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
01/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and notice strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to KCC re phone script.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC; attention to notice mailing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to claims filing on settlement website; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and notice strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/31/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Update JD, AR, JJ, and AK re class notice and settlement website.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from class administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with R. DeWitte of KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00

02/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Update AR, JD, JJ, and AK re claims.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from California AG's office; consider response to same; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same; prepare response to California AG's office.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
02/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails from defense counsel re response to CAFA notice from California AG; prepare correspondence to California AG re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update on claims from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review court filing requesting docket sheet.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and notice update with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update from class administrator re claims.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review updated claims information from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to settlement website.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and notice strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review invoice from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice and claims update from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client; attention to filing of client's claim.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion for final approval and declaration in support.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
03/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review update claims data from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re affidavit in connection with final approval.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from KCC re notice affidavit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and analyze DC Circuit opinion in ACA International, and assess potential impact on litigation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
03/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on final approval papers.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.20	0.00	3.20	1,760.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on final approval papers.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.80	0.00	2.80	1,540.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review class member objection; strategy re opposition to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
03/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re response to objection, including arguments related to timing of fee petition and propriety of incentive awards.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re response to objections, including assessments of objections.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review claims update from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and settlement update with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/21/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re response to objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
03/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue work on final approval papers.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
03/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re response to objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel re response to objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
03/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with AK re response to objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to response to class member objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re final approval and response to objection with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to KCC re claims and any exclusions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response in opposition to class member objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.90	0.00	3.90	2,145.00
03/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review claims update from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/30/2018	Johnson,	NPAS	Review correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

	Charles T.	Solutions								
03/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review of draft declaration from KCC re notice; prepare correspondence to KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00	
03/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response to class member objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.60	0.00	3.60	1,980.00	
04/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of response to objection, motion for final approval, and motion for award of attorneys' fees and expenses.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00	
04/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise declaration of KCC; prepare correspondence to KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
04/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of response to objection, motion for final approval, and motion for award of attorneys' fees and expenses.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.90	0.00	2.90	1,595.00	
04/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review NCLC memorandum on impact of D.C. Circuit decision in ACA International.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft order of final approval; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00	
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
04/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re final approval papers with JD, JJ, AR, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversations with AR regarding objection and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review revised submission by KCC; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00	
04/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00	
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails from objector's counsel; discussion with AR re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue work on motion for final approval, motion for an award of attorneys' fees, response to objection, and declaration in support of fees and expenses; review, revise and finalize same for filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	6.70	0.00	6.70	3,685.00	
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's draft response to objection; discussion re same with AR; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00	
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Court attaching proposed order of final approval.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to KCC re documents to be added to settlement website.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Defendant's response to objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
04/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting Defendant's motion to file under seal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding J. Dickenson objection; related call with AR and Doug Campion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00	
04/10/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
04/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector's counsel, including draft Rule 11 motion; strategy re response to same; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	715.00	
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re response to Rule 11 letter and draft motion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone call with Doug Campion (0.3); follow up call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
04/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Rob DeWitte.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case update with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re objector with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
04/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Meeting with Rob DeWitte of KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00	
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review affidavit of objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re objection with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00	
04/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
04/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objection by Jenna Dickenson in different case and related filings; prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
04/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re response to objection with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00	
04/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re TCPA cases where John W. Davis has filed objections and Rule 11 motions.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00	
05/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for final fairness hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00	
05/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with AR re response to objection and strategy re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00	
05/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	
05/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00	

05/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy calls with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re appellate bonds.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for final fairness hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.20	0.00	2.20	1,210.00
05/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR, JD, JJ, and AK regarding final fairness hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for final fairness hearing, including consideration of case law cited by objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00
05/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for final fairness hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	5.50	0.00	5.50	3,025.00
05/06/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for final fairness hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00
05/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for final fairness hearing; travel to and attend final fairness hearing; return travel.	Ready	550.00 hr	5.50	0.00	5.50	3,025.00
05/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final order and judgment; prepare correspondence to KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Respond to media inquiries.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to media inquiries.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to case and funding deadlines; emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with NBC News reporter.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with NBC News reporter.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Objector strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Objector strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review of TCPALand podcast touching on Reyes summary judgment opinion, ACA appeal, and other TCPA topics.	Ready	0 hr	0.80	440.00	0	0.00
05/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re objector appeal with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of appeal; research re other filings by objector's counsel and results.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
06/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to John W. Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with class member re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review research re posting of appellate bond; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
06/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to objector attorney.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/12/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding case strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with John W. Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions re objector appeal with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with John Davis; emails with J. Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/26/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with defense counsel and claims administrator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review King v. Time Warner Cable decision from the Second Circuit re capacity of automatic telephone dialing system, and consideration of potential impact of narrowed ATDS definition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/02/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with JD and AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

07/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare notice of appearance before Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/07/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review of objector's appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
08/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector's counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial research re response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
08/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/09/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel and AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review documents included in appeal appendix, including transcript of final fairness hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
08/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on mediation statement for Eleventh Circuit appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on mediation statement to the Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to all counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy call re client with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on mediation statement to Eleventh Circuit; review, revise and finalize same.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
08/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal and mediation strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for Eleventh Circuit mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
08/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/23/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Mediation strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for 11th Circuit mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
08/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Pre-mediation call with client (0.3); attend telephone mediation (1.5); follow up conferences with AR and JD.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.20	0.00	2.20	1,210.00
08/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion re legal research project with AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re motion for extension of time to file response brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/27/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to all counsel re extension of time to file response brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/28/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with court clerk re extension of response briefs.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple telephone discussions with client re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
08/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion of legal research with AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/30/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy re response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
09/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review final approval and fee order in Douglas v. The Western Union Company, 2018 WL 41841484 (N.D. Ill. Aug. 31, 2018).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
09/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying class certification in Luster v. Green Tree Servicing (N.D. Ga.).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/05/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on opposition to appellate brief; legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	6.50	0.00	6.50	3,575.00
09/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response brief on appeal; legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	8.50	0.00	8.50	4,675.00
09/14/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	6.00	0.00	6.00	3,300.00
09/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
09/16/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00

09/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response brief on appeal; review and revise same.	Ready	550.00 hr	5.50	0.00	5.50	3,025.00
09/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR regarding case strategy and appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/18/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Further review and revise response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise and finalize appellee brief for filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/19/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review NPAS Solutions' appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
09/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Circuit order in Marks v. Crunch, and consideration of potential impact of narrowed ATDS definition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector counsel; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order extending deadline for objector's reply brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review new request for comment from FCC re definition of automatic telephone dialing system.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Circuit decision in Muransky v. Godvia; strategy re supplemental filing; emails with defense counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
10/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on notice of supplemental authority; research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on notice of supplemental authority; review and revise same; emails with counsel for NPAS Solutions re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.90	0.00	1.90	1,045.00
10/04/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/10/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/10/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone call with 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion re appeal with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/17/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/24/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/25/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/29/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Southern District of Florida order adopting Marks v. Crunch in Adams v. Ocwen, and consideration of potential impact of narrowed ATDS definition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/31/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objectors' reply brief; discussion re same with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
11/01/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/08/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case and appeal update with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to grant of cert. in PDR Network v. Carlton & Harris, regarding whether Hobbs Act required district court to accept FCC's interpretation under Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/15/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review motion for en banc review in Muransky v. Godiva.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/20/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Cox v. Porsche Fin. Servs., Inc., No. 1:16-CV-23409, 2018 WL 5905381 (S.D. Fla. Nov. 9, 2018) (class certification)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/03/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/10/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from class member.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/11/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re FCC action on reassigned telephone number database and potential impact on liability for calls to reassigned telephone numbers.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
12/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/13/2018	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review of releases and commentary from FCC re reassigned number database and safe harbor for calls to reassigned numbers; review and consider FCC's December 13, 2018 Second Report and Order regarding reassigned numbers.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.00	0.00	2.00	1,100.00
01/03/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from class member.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/11/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review TCPA class certification order in Bauman v. Saxe, No. 14-cv-01125-RFB-PAL, 2019 WL 157923 (D. Nev. Jan. 10, 2019).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/14/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/25/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Respond to inquiry related to Mr. Johnson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00

03/05/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/26/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to oral argument in Supreme Court re deference owed to FCC under Hobbs Act in PDR Network LLC et al. v. Carlton & Harris Chiropractic Inc., case number 17-1705.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/26/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/27/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Northern District of Illinois class certification decision in Bakov v. Consolidated World Travel Inc., including discussion of propriety of reverse look ups to identify class members.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/27/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Case strategy with AR, JD, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/29/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Southern District of New York decision granting summary judgment for the plaintiff in Jiminez v. Credit One Bank, N.A., 2019 WL 1409425 (S.D.N.Y. March 28, 2019) and rejecting good faith reliance defense to reassigned number TCPA claim.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/01/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting class certification of TCPA case in Brown v. DirecTV (C.D. Cal. Mar. 29, 2019).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/10/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal strategy with AR, JD, JJ, and AK.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/15/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to client emails; check updated 11th circuit docket report.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/24/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 4th Circuit TCPA opinion in AASPC v. FCC declaring portion of TCPA unconstitutional, and consideration of potential impact on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/29/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying class certification in wrong number TCPA case in Revitch v. Citibank, N.A. (N.D. Cal.).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/30/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Melito v. Experian Mktg. Solutions, Inc. decision in the Second Circuit re overruling of objections to TCPA class settlement by objector represented by Eric Isaacson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/14/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to correspondence re client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/01/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review decision from Fourth Circuit Court of Appeals affirming class certification and verdict in Krakauer v. Dish Network, LLC (4th Cir. May 30, 2019).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/13/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider 9th Circuit decision in Duguid v. Facebook, No. 17-15320 (9th Cir. June 13, 2019), finding sufficient allegations of ATDS use and finding debt collection exemption to the TCPA unconstitutional.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/18/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/19/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re pending appeal and client communications.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/20/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Supreme Court opinion issued today in PDR Network, LLC v. Carton & Harris Chiropractic, Inc., regarding deference due to FCC interpretations of the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/08/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order of preliminary approval of TCPA class action settlement in Sheean v. Convergent Outsourcing (E.D. Mich.).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/23/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/25/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Senate and House versions of TCPA-related legislation, and consideration of impacts on definition of ATDS and called party.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/30/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Gorss Motels, Inc. v. Safemark Systems, Inc., Nos. 18-12511, 18-15232 (11th Cir. 2019) re deference owed to FCC rulings under the Hobbs Act in the context of the TCPA; strategy re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/14/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Breda v. Celco Partnership, Nos. 17-2196, 18-1010 (1st Cir. Aug. 2, 2019), regarding arbitration and wireless numbers under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/15/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Southern District of New York order denying class certification in wrong number TCPA case in Hunter v. Time Warner Cable, Inc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/19/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Allan v. Pennsylvania Higher Education Assistance Agency (W.D. Mich. Aug. 19, 2019), adopting Marks definition of an automatic telephone dialing system.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/04/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re status of appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/17/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review In the Matter of Advanced Methods to Target and Eliminate Unlawful Robocalls, CG Docket No. 17-15 (Sept. 12, 2019), extending deadlines for creation of reassigned numbers database.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/20/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Salcedo v. Hanna, et al., No. 17-14077, Plaintiff-Appellee's Petition for Rehearing and Rehearing En Banc (11th Cir. Sept. 18, 2019) (Article III standing under the TCPA).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/01/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to oral argument in Gadelhak v. AT&T, Inc., No. 19-1738 (7th Cir. Sept. 27, 2019)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00

			(definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA)						
10/07/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Muransky, et al. v. Godiva Chocolatier, Inc., No. 16-16486, Petition for Rehearing en Banc (11th Cir. Oct. 4, 2019 ("Whether a named plaintiff whose Article III standing is challenged at the Rule 23 class-certification and settlement-approval stages of litigation may treat Article III standing as a mere pleading requirement or must offer proof of injury appropriate to post-pleading stages of litigation."); and order accepting petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/07/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Sliwa v. Bright House Networks, Case No. 2:16-cv-235, 2019 WL 4744938 (M.D. Fl. Sept. 27, 2019), denying class certification in wrong number TCPA action.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/07/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review supplemental authority by Jenna Dickenson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/15/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/16/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re conversation with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/18/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider petition for certiorari in Duguid v. Facebook, Inc. (Oct. 17, 2019) re constitutionality of TCPA and definition of ATDS under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/06/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/15/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Cordoba v. DirecTV (11th Cir. Nov. 15, 2019) re issues concerning class certification in TCPA actions and Article III standing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/27/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text of compromise robocall bill, S. 151,; strategy re impact on case.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/03/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/11/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument in Tabitha Evans v. Pennsylvania Higher Education, No. 18-14586 (11th Circuit Dec. 6, 2019), regarding the definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
12/12/2019	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to oral argument in Glasser v. Hilton Grand Vacations Company, No. 18-14499 (11th Cir. Dec. 6, 2019).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
01/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to grant of writ of certiorari in William P. Barr et al. v. American Association of Political Consultants, Inc. et al., No. 19-631, and consideration of potential impact on case.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Dorfman v. CVS, No. 1:17-cv-159, Doc. 75 (N.D. Ill. Jan. 21, 2020), regarding motion to strike class allegations.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/27/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Glasser and Evans opinions and dissent from Eleventh Circuit (issued Jan. 27, 2020) re definition of ATDS under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re status of appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Hart v. BHH, LLC, 2020 WL 254779 (Jan. 17, 2020) re quick pay provision in class action settlement agreement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/04/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review summary judgment and class certification order in Johnson v. Comodo Group, Inc. (D.N.J. Jan. 31, 2010), including finding that a predictive dialer is an ATDS.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client (0.2); prepare correspondence to client (0.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re conversation with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Petition for Rehearing En Banc in Glasser v. Hilton Grand Vacations Company, LLC, No. 18-14499-J (11th Cir. Feb. 14, 2020).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Ward v. Flagship Credit Acceptance LLC, No. 17-2069 (E.D. Pa. Feb. 13, 2020) (denying motion for final approval of TCPA class action settlement).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Gadelhak v. AT&T Services, Inc., No. 19-1738 (7th Cir. Feb. 19, 2020) re definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding appeal oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from 11th Circuit re oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial re-review of briefs in advance of oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
02/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/04/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order directing filing of supplemental appendix, and coordination re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
03/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence to and from class member.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Mussat v. IQVIA (7th Cir. Mar. 11, 2020) (determining that Bristol-Myers decision does not	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00

			apply to Rule 23 class actions brought in federal court and asserting federal claims).						
03/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of oral argument, and discussion with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone message for clerk re timing of oral argument hearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of appearance of Benjamin Nutley.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/20/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review United States v. Dish Network, LLC (7th Cir. Mar. 26, 2020) re agency issues under the TCPA and damages.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with class member.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with class member re change of address.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/07/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Duran v. La Boom Disco, Inc., No. 19-600-cv (2nd Cir. Apr. 7, 2020) (definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider supplemental authority submitted by objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to setting of oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/20/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Perez v. Rash Curtis & Associates, No. 4:16-cv-03396-YGR, 2020 WL 1904533 (N.D. Cal. Apr. 17, 2020), regarding post-trial motions in certified wrong number TCPA class action.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from class member Jeannette Atkins.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Defendant's notice of supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider opinion of Eleventh Circuit Court of Appeals in Medley v. Dish Network, LLC, No. 18-13841 (11th Cir. May 1, 2020), regarding ability to revoke contractual consent under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Listen to and note Supreme Court oral argument in Barr v. American Association of Political Consultants, Inc. re constitutionality of the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
05/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD and AR client incentive award.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Numerous telephone conferences with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.70	0.00	1.70	935.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/13/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/14/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
05/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review AK research re decisions granting class certification in TCPA cases over the past 3 years.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review filing from Eleventh Circuit re oral argument; consideration of whether to submit briefs on the papers.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re whether to stipulate to submission of appeal on the briefs.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple discussions with AR re appeal and related oral argument strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel and objectors' counsel re potential for submission of appeal on the briefs.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
05/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Suttles v. Facebook, Inc., Case No. 18-cv-10004, ECF No. 58 (W.D. Tex. May 20, 2020) (definition of an ATDS as defined by the TCPA, characteristics of a telephone solicitation under the TCPA).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with court clerk.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re panel for oral argument (0.8); discussion with AR re panel assignment (0.2).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re time allotment for oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

05/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
06/02/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 9th Circuit Court of Appeals decision in N.L. v. Credit One Bank, Nos. 19-15399, 19-15398 (9th Cir. June 3, 2020) (prior express consent must come from the party actually called, not the intended recipient of the calls).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from 11th Circuit (0.2); prepare correspondence to defense counsel (0.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/03/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re strategy for oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/04/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re strategy for oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/04/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.30	0.00	3.30	1,815.00
06/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel and court clerk re allocation of minutes for oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
06/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument in appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.00	0.00	4.00	2,200.00
06/07/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument in appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.00	0.00	4.00	2,200.00
06/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.00	0.00	3.00	1,650.00
06/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for and participate in mock oral argument with litigation team.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
06/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00
06/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding upcoming oral argument before the 11th Cir.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for oral argument on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	9.00	0.00	9.00	4,950.00
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Post oral argument strategy discussion with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Post oral argument strategy discussion with JJ and JD.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/12/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for, attend, and present oral argument before 11th Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
06/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review settlement agreement for impact of potential reversal and remand.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research case law re incentive awards to class action plaintiffs since oral argument.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
06/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with JD, and meeting with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Supreme Court's decision in Barr v. American Association of Political Consultants (July 6, 2020) re constitutionality of the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
07/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of Supreme Court's grant of certiorari Facebook v. Duguid re definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re potential supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/24/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Hayhurst v. Keller Williams Realty, Inc., 2020 WL 4208046 (M.D.N.C. July 22, 2020) re definition of an ATDS under the TCPA and standards for vicarious liability.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Sixth Circuit's opinion in Allan v. PHEAA (6th Cir. July 29, 2020) (definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Meeting with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple telephone discussion with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re conversations with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/31/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/10/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Pearson v. Target Corp., No. 19-3095, 2020 WL 4519053 (7th Cir. Aug. 6, 2020) (impact of class action settlement objectors who drop appeals to obtain payment).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re voice message from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/08/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review brief of the United States to the Supreme Court in Facebook v. Duguid, No. 19-511, re	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00

definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.

09/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Aboud v. Agentra, LLC, 2020 WL 5526557 (N.D. Tex. Sept. 14, 2020) (certifying class action under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act and discussing viability of self-identification of class members).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review opinion on appeal (.4); considerations regarding next steps and whether to seek en banc review (1).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Eric Isaacson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding 11th Cir. opinion, petition for rehearing, and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with litigation team re: responses to media inquiries over appellate ruling, and respond to multiple media inquiries.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re potential motion for en banc review.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
09/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re potential motion for en banc review.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
09/20/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategize re en banc review and next steps, including working with other firms.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR and JD re hearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding case strategy regarding petition for rehearing en banc and appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Boies Schiller attorneys (.7), and consideration of same (0.5).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Multiple calls with Keller Lenkner attorneys (.8); research re Keller Lenkner attorneys and reputation (1.5); calls and emails with Lief Cabraser attorneys re appeal (0.8); call and emails with Bobby Gilbert (.7); call with Sam Isacaroff (.7); call with AR, JD, and JJ (.5); strategy considerations re appellate team (1.5).	Ready	550.00 hr	6.50	0.00	6.50	3,575.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with JJ re appeal strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Warren Postman and Travis Lenkner re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
09/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Appeal-related strategy, including multiple phone calls and emails with potential appellate counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
09/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Travis Lenkner.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Numerous emails and strategy re potential amicus submissions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/23/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/24/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with appellate team (.5); emails with appellate team (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
09/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of extension request on en banc petition (0.4); emails with co-counsel re same (0.2); prepare correspondence to other parties re same (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
09/25/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize motion for extension of time to submit en banc petition; emails with co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order extending deadline to file en banc petition (.1); emails with appellate team (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's motion for extension of time to seek rehearing (.1); review order granting same (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/01/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's bill of costs; research local rules re objections to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/02/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with appellate team.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/02/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with AR re discussions with appellate team.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/06/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with class member John Green (.2); emails with KCC re Mr. Green's claims submission.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft petition for en banc review.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
10/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails among interested counsel (.2); prepare correspondence to co-counsel re petition for rehearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/15/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with AR re revisions to appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/16/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appellate briefing, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review brief of respondent to the United States Supreme Court in Duguid v. Facebook, Inc., No. 19-511, re statutory interpretation of term "automatic telephone dialing system" under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00

10/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails among appellate counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/19/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review revised petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/20/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise motion for rehearing en banc (.4); emails with co-counsel re same (.2).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
10/20/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appeal strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider emails among appellate counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re motion for rehearing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel re finalization of motion for en banc review.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Dickenson's petition for en banc review.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/22/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Final review and revision of draft motion for rehearing en banc; multiple discussions with co-counsel re same and finalization for filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.00	0.00	2.00	1,100.00
10/26/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notices of appearance of co-counsel in appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/27/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel re amicus filings.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notices of appearance of amicus filers.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re status of appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review 11th Circuit en banc decision in Muransky v. Godiva Chocolatier (Oct. 28, 2020).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
10/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review amicus submission of Professor Rubenstein.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/29/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review of amicus petitions and proposed briefs.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
10/30/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review N.D. Ohio decision dismissing TCPA claims due to lack of subject matter jurisdiction as a result of Barr in Lidenbaum v. Realgy (N.D. Ohio Oct. 29, 2020), and consideration of impact on matter.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
11/05/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting amicus submissions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/09/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order directing withholding of mandate.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/18/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Petitioner Facebook's reply brief to the Supreme Court in Facebook v. Duguid, No. 19-511, re definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/01/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Medical & Chiropractic Clinic, Inc. v. Oppenheim, No. 18-13714 (11th Cir. Dec. 1, 2020) re duties of class counsel to the class and named plaintiff.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/02/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review briefing and legal memorandum from Public Justice re motions to dismiss for lack of constitutional standing based on Lindenbaum v. Realgy, LLC, No. 1:19 CV 2862, 2020 WL 6361915, at *2 (N.D. Ohio Oct. 29, 2020); Creasy v. Charter Commcâ€™ns, Inc., No. CV 20-1199, 2020 WL 5761117, at *3 (E.D. La. Sept. 28, 2020).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/07/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Lucoff v. Navient Solutions, LLC, No. 19-13482 (11th Cir. Dec. 4, 2020) (revocation of consent in TCPA matter).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Hussain v. Synergy Marketing Advisors, et al. (M.D. Fla. Dec. 11, 2020), finding lack of subject matter jurisdiction for TCPA claims pre-dating Barr opinion from Supreme Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/11/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Abramson v. Federal Insurance Company, et al. (M.D. Fla. Dec. 11, 2020), finding subject matter jurisdiction for TCPA claims pre-dating Barr opinion from Supreme Court, and rejecting Creasy opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/17/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Shen v. Tricolor California Auto Group, LLC, No. 2:20-cv-07419-PA-AGR, ECF No. 35 (C.D. Cal. Dec. 17, 2020) (denying motion to dismiss TCPA claims for lack of subject matter jurisdiction based on Barr).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/21/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Trujillo v. Free Energy Savings Company, LLC, No. 5:19-cv-02072-MCS, Doc. 76 (C.D. Cal. Dec. 21, 2020) (denying motion for judgment on the pleadings re constitutionality of TCPA pre-Barr and post 2015 amendment).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/28/2020	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/04/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Factual investigation re client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
01/12/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Stoutt v. Travis Credit Union, No. 2:20-cv-01280 WBS AC (E.D. Cal. Jan. 12, 2021) (denying the defendant's Rule 12(b)(1) motion to dismiss based on Creasy and Lindenbaum)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/21/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Rieker v. National Car Cure, LLC, No. 3:20-cv-05901-TKW-HTC (N.D. Fla. Jan. 5, 2021) (Article III standing under the TCPA, rejecting Creasy and Lindenbaum).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Lees v. Quest Diagnostics Incorporated, No. 3:20-cv-02546-JZ (N.D. Ohio Jan. 26, 2021)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

			(Article III standing under the robocall restriction for the TCPA, and refusing to accept Creasy and Lindenbaum)						
01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Conversation with AR regarding status of petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/26/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with appellate counsel re en banc petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider McCurley v. Royal Sea Cruises, Inc., No. 17-CV-00986-BAS-AGS, 2021 WL 288164 (S.D. Cal. Jan. 28, 2021) (Article III standing under the TCPA, rejecting Creasy and Lindenbaum).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/02/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Johansen v. LoanDepot.com, LLC, No. 8:20-cv-919-DOC (JDE), Doc. 71 (C.D. Cal. Jan. 31, 2021) (denying motion to dismiss TCPA claims for lack of subject matter jurisdiction).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/16/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Bonkuri v. Grand Caribbean Cruises, Inc., No. 0:20-cv-60638-WPD (S.D. Fla. 2021), rejecting motion to dismiss TCPA claims for lack of subject matter jurisdiction and rejecting Creasy opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/17/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Williams v. PillPack, LLC, 2021 WL 535215 (W.D. Wash. Feb. 12, 2021) (granting motion for class certification in case under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/22/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider briefs of the United States (.3) and 34 states (.2) in support of reversal of Lindenbaum decision in Sixth Circuit Court of Appeals (constitutionality of robocall restriction pre-Barr and post 2015 amendment).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
03/10/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Miles v. Medcredit, 2021 WL 872678 (E.D. Mo. March 9, 2021) (rejecting Creasy and Lindenbaum and sustaining claims under the TCPA, as well as denying motion to dismiss class action allegations at pleadings stage).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/10/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/22/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Massaro v. Beyond Meat, Inc., 2021 WL 948805 (S.D. Cal. March 21, 2021) (rejecting Creasy opinion and finding TCPA claims actionable that occurred before Barr and after the 2015 amendment).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/24/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/25/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Lyngaas v. Ag, No. 20-1199, 2021 WL 1115870 (6th Cir. Mar. 24, 2021) (evidentiary burden for proof of class-related elements; claims administration process in TCPA class action; and refusal to extend Bristol Myers to class actions)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
03/31/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Moody v. Synchrony Bank, 2021 WL 1153036 (M.D. Ga. March 26, 2021) (rejecting Creasy and finding TCPA claims constitutional from 2015 until severance in Barr).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider impact of Supreme Court's decision in Facebook, Inc. v. Duguid, No. 19-511 (April 1, 2021) (definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
04/05/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Cunningham v. Matrix Financial Services, LLC, 2021 WL 1226618 (E.D. Tex. March 31, 2021) (finding robocall ban unenforceable after 2105 and before issuance of Barr decision).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/15/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Whittaker v. Winred Technical Services, LLC, 2921 WL 1102297 (D. Ariz. March 23, 2021) (rejecting motion to dismiss based on Creasy).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/20/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Watch oral argument before 11th Circuit in Equifax class action.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
05/10/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Lerner v. AmeriFinancial Solutions, LLC, 2021 WL 1785138 (D. Md. May 5, 2021), finding robocalls unrelated to government debt collection to be actionable prior to Barr v. AAPC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/16/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re decisions accepting and rejecting Johnson v NPAS Solutions.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
05/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider draft notice of supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR and JD re supplemental authority.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/19/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review response to supplemental authority from objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/19/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to correspondence from class member, and emails with KCC re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/14/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/15/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/25/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider applicability of Supreme Court decision re Article III standing in TransUnion LLC v. Ramirez, No. 20-297, 594 U.S. ____ (2021).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/27/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00

07/06/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Connor v. One Life America, Inc., 2021 WL 2667063 (D.S.C. June 29, 2021), finding TCPA constitutional pre-Barr and after 2015 amendment.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/09/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Gross v. GG Homes, Inc., No. 3:32-cv-00271-DMS-BGS, 2021 WL 2863623 (S.D. Cal. July 8, 2021), and Callier v. GreenSky, Inc., No. EP-20-CV-00304-KC, 2021 WL 2688622 (W.D. Tex. May 10, 2021), re sufficient allegations for ATDS usage at the pleadings stage.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/18/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting Lorelei J. Van Weyâ€™s motion to withdraw as counsel for Appellee NPAS Solutions, LLC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/31/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read Bais Yaakov of Spring Valley v. ACT, Inc., No. 20-1537, 2021 WL 3855656 (1st Cir. Aug. 30, 2021) (predominance analysis in connection with a TCPA class action)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/09/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Lindenbaum v. Realogy, LLC, No. 20-4252 (6th Cir. Sept. 9, 2021) (holding that robocall provision of TCPA was enforceable during time that government-debt exception was in effect).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/27/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Hogans v. Charter Communications, Inc., dba Spectrum, No. 5:20-cv-00566-D, ECF No. 24 (E.D.N.C. Sept. 24, 2021) (order denying motion to dismiss TCPA claims premised on Barr v. American Association of Political Consultants, Inc., 140 S. Ct. 2335 (2020); finding the TCPA's robocall restriction constitutional; and, rejecting v. Charter Communications, Inc., 489 F. Supp. 3d 499 (E.D. La. 2020)).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/05/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Johansen v. Bluegreen Vacations Unlimited, Inc., No. 9:20-cv-81076-RS (S.D. Fla. Sept. 30, 2021) (denying class certification in TCPA class action).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/01/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare 11th Circuit renewal application.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/13/2021	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with counsel re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/20/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Meier v. Allied Interstate, LLC, No. 20-55286 (9th Cir. Jan. 19, 2022) (finding LiveVox HCI to not qualify as an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
03/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re incentive award decisions, including review of In re Checking Account Overdraft Litig., 2022 WL 472057 (11th Cir. Feb. 16, 2022), and emails with litigation team re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
03/11/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Bustillos v. West Covina Corporate Fitness, Inc., 2022 WL 423396 (C.D. Cal. Jan. 3, 2022), denying motion for class certification in proposed TCPA class action.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/29/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Bumpus v. Realogy Brokerage Group LLC, No. 3:19-cv-03309-JD, Doc. 223 (N.D. Cal. March 23, 2022), certifying classes under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act over objection.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/26/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/04/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review motion to withdraw by Travis Lenkner.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order granting motion to withdraw as counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to emails from amicus counsel; emails with co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying the parties' respective motions for summary judgment in certified TCPA class action in Bumpus v. Realogy Brokerage Group LLC, 2022 WL 1489470 (N.D. Cal. May 11, 2022).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review unopposed motion to withdraw as counsel for Professor Rubenstein.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/22/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/02/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Swanson v. National Credit Services, Inc., 2022 WL 1746776 (W.D. Wash. May 31, 2022) (certifying class action under the TCPA and finding that TCPA class members have Article III standing).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Williamson v. Irving K. Motor Company LLC, 2022 WL 2053179 (N.D. Tex. June 7, 2022), denying motion to dismiss TCPA claims and rejecting Creasy defense.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/15/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Panzarella v. Navient Solutions, Inc., No. 20-2371 (3d Cir. June 14, 2022), re necessary capacity to be considered an automatic telephone dialing system under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
07/02/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Barnes v. Allsup Employment Services, LLC, No. 21-cv-21121-Bloom/Otazo-Reyes, 2022 LEXIS 117003 (S.D. Fla. July 1, 2022), denying motion for class certification in proposed TCPA class action due to individual issues re standing of absent class members.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00

07/02/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/04/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Arkin v. Pressman, Inc., No. 21-11019, 2022 WL 2352522 (11th Cir. June 30, 2022), re attorneys' fees in TCPA class actions resulting from the creation of a common fund.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Moskowitz v. American Savings Bank, F.S.B., 37 F.4th 538 (9th Cir. June 10, 2022), regarding whether and how to award attorneys' fees to prevailing TCPA defendant.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider inquiry from Law360 and emails with co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/25/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review article on status of petition for rehearing en banc.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/27/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Drazen v. Godaddy.com, LLC, No. 21-10199 (11th Cir. July 27, 2022), regarding need for all absent class members to have standing in TCPA class action settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re order denying motion for reconsideration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider order denying motion for reconsideration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
08/03/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Considerations re potential for writ of certiorari to Supreme Court, and emails with co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
08/04/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Vance v. DirecTV, LLC, 2022 WL 304465 (N.D. W. Va. Aug. 1, 2022), certifying class action under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act and crediting the expert testimony of Anya Verkhovskaya.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/04/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel, and emails re response to Law360 inquiry.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/04/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding appeal-related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with Ashley Keller and AR regarding possible petition for certiorari (.4); follow up discussion with AR (.4); emails with A. Keller (.2).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
08/05/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review of Law360 article re appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/08/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re potential for writ of cert to Supreme Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR and JD regarding potential petition for certiorari and related case strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call AR and JD re potential petition for cert.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/10/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JD re strategy for cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/15/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with S. Davidson at Robbins Geller re potential cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re cert petition and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel for NPAS.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with counsel re potential cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appellate strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel re cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/23/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider order granting preliminary approval to wrong number TCPA class action settlement in Miles v. Medcredit, Inc., No. 4:20-cv-1186-JAR (E.D. Mo. Aug. 23, 2022).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re certiorari petition, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/25/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Kelly v. RealPage, Inc., --- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 3642113 (Aug. 24, 2022) re Article III standing and ascertainability standard on motion for class certification.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Hyland v. Navient Corporation, No. 20-3765-cv (L) (2d Cir. Sept. 7, 2022), approving class action settlement and approving incentive awards to the class representatives.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel re Hyland v. Navient Corporation, No. 20-3765-cv (L) (2d Cir. Sept. 7, 2022), approving class action settlement and approving incentive awards to the class representatives.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re Second Circuit opinion, cert petition, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/06/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/13/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider In re Apple Inc. Device Performance Litig., --- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 4492079 (9th Cir. Sept. 28, 2022), regarding	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00

incentive awards under Rule 23 and proper standard for evaluating pre-certification class action settlements.

10/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise petition for writ of certiorari.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.70	0.00	1.70	935.00
10/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue to review and revise cert petition, and prepare correspondence to co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
10/18/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider AR comments to draft petition for writ of certiorari (.2); emails with co-counsel (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/19/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re draft cert petition, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Wakefield v. Visalus, Inc., -- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 11530386 (9th Cir. Oct. 20, 2022), regarding post-trial issues in certified TCPA class action, including constitutionality of aggregate award of TCPA damages.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to final Supreme Court petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/24/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review of emails among counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/25/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review bill of costs and mandate.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/25/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re Supreme Court petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/26/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re cert petition and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/27/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/11/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails to and from objector's counsel re request for extension of time.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Adler v. All Hours Plumbing Drain Cleaning 24-7-365 LLC, 2022 WL 15513196 (D. Utah Oct. 27, 2022), certifying class action under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to AR admission to U.S. Supreme Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Borden v. eFinancial, LLC, -- F.4th ----, 2022 WL 16955661 (9th Cir. Nov. 16, 2022), regarding definition of an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/28/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text order extending deadline for response to cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/30/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider COY EVANS, JEFFREY ADAMS, BERNARD BROWN, ALBERT DUDLEY, MICHAEL GIELLO, et al., v. OCWEN LOAN SERVICING, LLC, No. 21-14045, 2022 WL 17259718, at *1 (11th Cir. Nov. 29, 2022), regarding Article III standing for TCPA claims.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/06/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's cert petition re calculation of attorneys' fees.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/06/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with co-counsel re objector's cert petition re calculation of attorneys' fees.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/07/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of waiver of opposition to cert petition, and emails with co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/08/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider order setting status conference, and discussion re same with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review amended order setting status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to email correspondence from objector's counsel re PHV admission.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/09/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re potential stay in district court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding upcoming conference with court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying E. Isaacson PHV request.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to objector's counsel re potential motion for stay.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/12/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare motion to stay and proposed order re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to co-counsel re motion to stay and proposed order re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re motion to stay in district court, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel re motion to stay.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with objector's counsel re motion to stay.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize motion to stay and proposed order re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/16/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order staying case (.1); prepare correspondence to appellate counsel re same (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Murray v. Grocery Delivery E-Services USA Inc., No. 21-1931, 2022 WL 17729630 (1st Cir. Dec. 16, 2022), reversing approval of TCPA class action settlement but holding incentive awards to be lawful.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
12/17/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

12/20/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Reuters article regarding petition for cert. to Supreme Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/21/2022	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's response to petition for writ of certiorari.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re cert petitions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review reply in support of petition for writ of certiorari.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re Supreme Court filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to co-counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order administratively closing case.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Initial review of answer to objector's petition for certiorari.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
02/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re cert opposition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue review of opposition to cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
02/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to filed brief in opposition to cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re cert petitions, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review cert petition filed by objector's counsel from order in Second Circuit regarding incentive awards, and emails with co-counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
02/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Williams v. The Pisa Group, 2023 WL 2227697 (E.D. Pa. Feb. 24, 2023), certifying class action under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
03/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/28/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review supplemental brief re cert petition.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's supplemental brief re cert petitions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re cert. petition denial, next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to denial of cert petition and consideration of next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
04/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to co-counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re cert denial, supplemental briefing, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare notice of denial of petitions for certiorari.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of whether to request supplemental briefing, and potential pitfalls, including re-review of appellate decisions.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JD re next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review paperless order setting status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/21/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from Court re Zoom status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR regarding upcoming status hearing and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
04/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for upcoming status hearing, and review of briefing and Eleventh Circuit order.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for (1.7) and attend (1) status conference with Court.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.70	0.00	2.70	1,485.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone discussion with AR and JD re status conference and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone discussion with defense counsel after status conference.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/26/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case status and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/22/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Bakov v. Consol. World Travel, Inc., No. 21-2653, 2023 WL 3558175 (7th Cir. May 19, 2023) (when cost of class notice can be shifted to the defendant, and one-way-intervention, in a certified TCPA class action)	Ready	0 hr	0.30	165.00	0	0.00
05/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/31/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re renewed final approval order, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Boger v. Citrix Systems, Inc., 2023 WL 3763974 (D. Md. June 1, 2013), certifying TCPA class action for settlement purposes, granting final approval to proposed	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00

			settlement, approving incentive award, and awarding attorneys' fees.						
06/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Dickson v. Direct Energy, LP, --- F.4th ---, 2023 WL 3749640 (6th Cir. June 1, 2023), regarding Article III standing under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act for receipt of a single prerecorded voice message, and related analysis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Shoemaker v. Richard Zeitlin, et al, 2023 WL 3826460 (M.D. Pa. June 5, 2023), regarding viability of TCPA claims that pre-date Barr, a motion to dismiss TCPA claims, and issues related to personal jurisdiction.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order on remand, and consideration of next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
06/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re order on remand.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review recording of oral argument before the Eleventh Circuit, en banc, in Drazen v. GoDaddy, regarding Article III standing for receipt of text messages under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act in the context of a class action settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
06/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re order on remand, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re potential appeal, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Hall v. Smosh Dot Com, Inc., --- F.4th ---, 2023 WL 4281815 (9th Cir. June 30, 2023), finding Article III standing for TCPA claims for owner/subscriber of cellular telephone number even if different person received the calls at issue.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's notice of appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review civil docketing notice and attention to related deadlines, and review notice of appearance of John W. Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare notice of counsel appearance.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider en banc decision in Drazen v. GoDaddy.com, LLC, No. 21-10199 (11th Cir. July 24, 2023), regarding Article III standing for receipt of a single text message/call in proposed TCPA class action.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/26/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review appellant's filings, including certificate of interested persons and corporate disclosure statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of appearance of JD.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/03/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to order re mediation, and consideration of same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of appearance of M. Monaghan.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with E. Isaacson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Trim v. Reward Zone USA LLC, No. 22-55517 (9th Cir. Aug. 8, 2023), regarding definition of an artificial or prerecorded voice under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re mediation, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare draft certificate of interested persons, and review of local rules re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
08/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft certificate of interested persons, and emails with JD re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice re briefing schedule on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Brief telephone conference with 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Finalize certificate of interested persons.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Complete Eleventh Circuit stock symbol entry.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding status of case and appellate mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00

08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with 11th Circuit mediator, and prepare correspondence to opposing counsel re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review background check report re client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider emails from objector's counsel and mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with counsel for objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Moses v. The New York Times Company, No. 21-cv-2556 (2nd Cir. Aug. 17, 2023), regarding standards of review of class action settlements, attorneys' fees, and incentive awards under Rule 23(e).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
08/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector's counsel, and emails and consideration re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/22/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order extending deadline for appellant's brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/28/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of strategy for mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
08/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re mediation and appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
08/30/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare mediation statement to the Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.70	0.00	3.70	2,035.00
08/30/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise draft mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/30/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails and telephone conference with private investigator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
08/31/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
09/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize mediation statement to Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
09/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with private investigator, who advised of Mr. Johnson's passing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/02/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from investigator, and emails with litigation team re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding case strategy, Mr. Johnson's death, and upcoming mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research re next steps upon death of class representative after judgment, and consideration re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re client death and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with JJ re appeal-related research.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Follow up call with AR.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review case law from JJ.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with AR re mediation and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC re Florida claimants, and attention to list of Florida claimants.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Florida claimants re case update and next steps, and telephone conferences with claimants.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
09/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with mediator to apprise of Mr. Johnson's passing (.3), review correspondence re rescheduled mediation (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration and strategy re potential substitution of plaintiffs, and calls and emails with class members.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone calls with NPAS class claimants.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR and JD regarding mediation and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
09/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JJ re: research findings	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence to objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read JJ research regarding communications with absent class members (.2); related emails with litigation team (.1)	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and new plaintiff strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone discussions with claiming class members.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Charles Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

09/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding discussions with counsel for Defendant.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails and calls with claimants.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
09/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with Charles Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with investigator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re Charles Fishman and motion for leave to substitute party.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re potential new client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Charles Fishman (.4); prepare engagement correspondence to Mr. Fishman (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone call with ECF Help Desk.	Ready	0 hr	0.10	55.00	0	0.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on suggestion of death and motion to substitute parties.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with KCC.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with Charles Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion re new plaintiff with JJ.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review case law re substitutions of plaintiffs on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
09/26/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare follow up correspondence to defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re motion for substitution, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/27/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise suggestion of death and motion to substitute plaintiff-appellant.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
09/28/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize suggestion of death and motion for substitution of party.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
09/28/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appeal strategy and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with counsel for objector.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Follow up call with objector's counsel (.2); review and respond to emails from objector's counsel (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with AR re calls with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with JD.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/05/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with JD re hearing on motion to dismiss.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review emails to and from mediator's office and objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re conversations with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order extending briefing deadlines.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review notice of mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JD re conversations with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's response to motion to substitute, and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
10/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re objector's response and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/10/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of reply in support of motion to substitute, and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/11/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review case law from JD re Rule 43 (.1); phone call with JD re same (.4).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/12/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare draft reply in support of motion for substitution.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
10/12/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise reply to motion to substitute and emails with litigation team re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise draft reply to motion to substitute.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00

10/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Samson v. United Healthcare Services, Inc., 2023 WL 6793973 (W.D. Wash. Oct. 13, 2023), certifying two wrong number classes under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding mediation-related issues and reply in support of motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/16/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize reply in support of motion for substitution, and strategy discussions with litigation team re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
10/17/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider settlement offer from objector, and prepare draft response to same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and settlement strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone discussion with John Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/19/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/23/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare motion for leave to file out of time corrected reply brief, research re same, and revise and finalize same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
10/23/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare corrected reply brief for submission with motion for leave.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Davis v. Capital One, N.A., 2023 WL 6964051 (E.D. Va. Oct. 20, 2023), denying class certification in proposed wrong number class action under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
10/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise settlement-related correspondence to objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
10/24/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/25/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and settlement strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review In re Blue Cross Blue Shield Antitrust Litig., --- F.4th ---- (11th Cir. Oct. 25, 2023) re standards for settlement approval and awards of attorneys' fees.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/09/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate mediation strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and settlement strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Charles Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Lee v. Buth-Na-Bodhaige, Inc., 2019 IL App (5th) 180033 (2019), re objections to class action settlement by Jenna Dickenson.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/30/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/01/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order of limited remand and consideration of next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
12/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re limited remand and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/04/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Further consideration of limited remand and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/06/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and mediation strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/07/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone call with John W. Davis.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/08/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review correspondence from objector's counsel (.1); discuss same with AR (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re remand strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting deadline for motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/13/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to investigator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/14/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with private investigator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/15/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare draft declaration for Mr. Fishman, and consideration re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
12/18/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re Fishman declaration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
12/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with private investigator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/20/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re strategy on motion to substitute plaintiff and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/26/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to investigator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
12/27/2023	Johnson,	NPAS	Prepare correspondence to KCC re declaration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00

	Charles T.	Solutions							
12/28/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise KCC declaration.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
12/29/2023	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
01/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare status report in 11th Circuit, and review local rules re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
01/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion for appointment as class representative and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.30	0.00	3.30	1,815.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re motion to appoint class representative, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on motion to appoint class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
01/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re draft motion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise motion for appointment of class representative, and prepare proposed order re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.80	0.00	2.80	1,540.00
01/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with defense counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/04/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare meet and confer correspondence to objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re motion to substitute plaintiff.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider correspondence from objector regarding motion to appoint new class representative (.5); related discussion with AR(.5).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Research court records and bankruptcy docket re Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
01/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize motion to appoint Charles Fishman as class representative, and considerations re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
01/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding status of case and case strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
01/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on declaration in support of motion to appoint Mr. Fishman and research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.20	0.00	2.20	1,210.00
01/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re motion to appoint Mr. Fishman, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Receive and review objector's response to motion to substitute name plaintiff, and supporting declaration and exhibits.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Considerations of reply in support of motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
01/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Considerations of reply in support of motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
01/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Considerations of reply in support of motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on reply in support of motion to substitute class representative, and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	7.50	0.00	7.50	4,125.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Van Elzen v. Advisors Ignite USA LLC, 2024 WL 195473 (E.D. Wis. Jan. 18, 2024), denying motion for class certification in proposed class action under the Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JD re objector's opposition to motion to substitute Fishman as class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
01/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue work on reply in support of motion to appoint Mr. Fishman as class representative, and review and revise same.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
01/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re reply in support of motion to substitute, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue work on reply in support of motion to appoint Mr. Fishman as class representative, and review and revise same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.10	0.00	1.10	605.00
01/25/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize reply in support of motion to substitute class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	715.00
01/25/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
01/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
01/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare status report in Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
02/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Revise and finalize status report to Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order requiring supplemental filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re order requiring supplemental filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response to Court's order.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
02/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response to Court's order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
02/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response to Court's order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise response to Court's order.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.80	0.00	1.80	990.00

02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussions with JD re response to Court's order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.80	0.00	0.80	440.00
02/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re response to Court order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR and JD re filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JJ re filing.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize response to Court's order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.90	0.00	0.90	495.00
02/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re standards for appointment and disqualification of class counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.80	0.00	1.80	990.00
02/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Read order granting motion to appoint new class representative (.2); related discussion with JD (.4); discussion with AR (.4); discussion with JJ (.2); prepare correspondence to Mr. Fishman (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.30	0.00	1.30	715.00
02/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare draft status report for Eleventh Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
02/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding mediation-related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare follow up correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeals strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review briefing order from 11th Circuit.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and respond to correspondence from Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order of mediation and attention to related deadlines.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
02/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to Mr. Fishman re order of mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
02/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with Mr. Fishman.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re case and appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
02/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone call with court clerk re status reports.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
03/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re mediation statement, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.30	0.00	2.30	1,265.00
03/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client re draft mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR re appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's opening brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
04/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and revise mediation statement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re appeal strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal and mediation strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize mediation brief, and prepare correspondence to mediator's office re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.70	0.00	0.70	385.00
04/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review transcript of oral argument on remand.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to opposing counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with 11th Circuit mediator.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conferences with court clerk.	Ready	0 hr	0.20	110.00	0	0.00
04/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate mediation, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider In re Wawa, Inc. Data Sec. Litig., No. 2:19-cv-06019-GEKP (E.D. Pa.), re calculation of attorneys' fees in class action settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
04/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider correspondence from objector's counsel re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding upcoming mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00

04/15/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Telephone conference with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with A. Paronich re experience with objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
04/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare for Eleventh Circuit mediation (.8), and attend mediation with Mr. Fishman (.6); follow up with client (.2).	Ready	550.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	880.00
04/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with AR and JD re mediation.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
04/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate brief and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
04/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Perrong v. Montgomery County Democratic Committee, 2024 WL 1651274 (3d Cir. April 17, 2024) regarding what constitutes an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/01/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate brief, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research in support of response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
05/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Soliman v. Subway Franchisee Advertising Fund Trust, Ltd., --- F.4th ---, 2024 WL 2097361 (2d Cir. May 10, 2024), regarding what constitutes an automatic telephone dialing system under the TCPA.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
05/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Drazen v. GoDaddy.com, LLC, --- F.4th ---, 2024 WL 2122466 (11th Cir. May 13, 2024), regarding reversal of approval of class action settlement under Telephone Consumer Protection Act.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.00	0.00	1.00	550.00
05/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Legal research re appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.00	0.00	3.00	1,650.00
05/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
05/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00
05/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.80	0.00	3.80	2,090.00
05/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
05/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate brief, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
05/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.30	0.00	3.30	1,815.00
05/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on appellate brief, and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	6.50	0.00	6.50	3,575.00
05/27/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on appellate brief, and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	4.50	0.00	4.50	2,475.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consider revisions to appellate brief from AR and JD, and further review and revise brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.80	0.00	1.80	990.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding response brief on appeal.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
05/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy with JJ re: Plaintiff's appellate response brief	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate brief, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
05/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Further review and revise appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
05/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Final reviews of appellate brief, and emails with Counsel Press re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.60	0.00	1.60	880.00
05/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Attention to finalization of appellate brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
06/05/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consider settlement options, and prepare correspondence to objector's counsel.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order extending deadline for appellant's reply brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/17/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding status of appeal and settlement discussions.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
06/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re reply brief on appeal, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
06/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/10/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate proceedings, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
07/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review Chieftain Royalty Co. v. SM Energy Co., 2024 WL 1905019 (10th Cir. May 1, 2014), approving incentive award of over \$200,000 to class representative.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/22/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider substituted opinion in Drazen v GoDaddy.com, LLC, 2024 WL 3422404 (11th Cir. July 16, 2024).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's reply brief.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.40	0.00	0.40	220.00
07/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of potential sur-reply, and emails re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
07/24/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re reply brief on appeal and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

07/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review In re: T-Mobile Customer Security Breach Litig., --- F.4th ---, 2024 WL 3561874 (8th Cir. July 29, 2024), regarding attorneys' fees in common fund class action settlement.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
07/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider objector's 28(j) submission, prepare response to same, and review, revise, and finalize same.	Ready	550.00 hr	2.50	0.00	2.50	1,375.00
07/31/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with AR re response to 28j letter.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
08/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider order vacating award of attorneys' fees.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/11/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with JJ re appellate order and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/12/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Call with AR regarding order from 11th Circuit, and related strategy.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
09/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/26/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review objector's bill of costs.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
09/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review and consider Defendant's motion to publish unpublished opinion and exhibits thereto, and legal research re same.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.40	0.00	1.40	770.00
09/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with client.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/02/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re strategy in response to motion to convert unpublished opinion to published opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/03/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Work on response in opposition to motion to publish Sept. 11, 2024 decision.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.50	0.00	1.50	825.00
10/07/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Continue preparation of response to motion to publish Sept. 11 opinion, and review and revise same.	Ready	550.00 hr	3.50	0.00	3.50	1,925.00
10/08/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review, revise, and finalize opposition to motion for publication.	Ready	550.00 hr	1.20	0.00	1.20	660.00
10/09/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re opposition to motion for publication, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/16/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re status of appellate proceedings, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/23/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appeal-related strategy, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/28/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order denying Defendant's motion for publication.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
10/29/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Strategy discussion with AR re next steps after denial of motion to publish opinion.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
10/30/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re appellate proceedings, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re mandate issued by 11th Circuit, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/06/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review issuance of mandate and order regarding bill of costs.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/13/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re remand, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.20	0.00	0.20	110.00
11/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review text order requiring submission of briefing schedule, and consideration of same.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.30	0.00	0.30	165.00
11/14/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare correspondence to counsel for objector re meet and confer call in response to court order.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Phone call with JD re upcoming call with objector's counsel (.2); then phone call with AR and JD re same (.3).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/18/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Consideration of proposed briefing schedule on remand (.2); Zoom conference with objector's counsel re same (.3); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.60	0.00	0.60	330.00
11/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Prepare motion for entry of briefing schedule in response to Court's order and proposed order re same (.4); prepare correspondence to objector's counsel re same (.1).	Ready	550.00 hr	0.50	0.00	0.50	275.00
11/19/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Emails with counsel for Defendant.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/20/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Review order setting briefing schedule.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00
11/21/2024	Johnson, Charles T.	NPAS Solutions	Discussion with litigation team re submission on remand, and next steps.	Ready	550.00 hr	0.10	0.00	0.10	55.00

Total Labor For Michael Greenwald 669.60 1,045.00 667.70 367,235.00
Total Expense For Michael Greenwald 0.00 0.00
Total For Michael Greenwald 367,235.00

Grand Total Labor 977.90 31,210.00 918.40 498,855.00
Grand Total Expenses 0.00 0.00
Grand Total 498,855.00